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TM GRAIN TRANSPORT
CoOST INDICATORS* Truck Rail Barge Ocean
Gulf Pacific
10/29/03 101 128 194 209 298
Compared to Last Week unchanged 4 4 4 4
*Indicator: Base Year 2000=100; Weekly Updates include Truck=Diesel; Rail=Nearby Secondary Rail
Market; Barge=Spot Illinois River Basis; Ocean Vessel based on Routes to Japan

Third Quarter Total Grain Inspections Up Slightly. During the

Third quarter grain inspections by ports third quarter of 2003, the Federal Grain Inspection Service (FGIS)
inspected 21.21 million metric tons of grain (wheat, corn, and
25, 02002 soybeans) for export from all U.S. ports (see figure). This is 1 percent

above the third quarter of 2002, 14 percent above the second quarter of
2003, and 10 percent below the 5-year average. While the amount of
grain inspected at the U.S. Gulf ports was down 11 percent from the 5-
year average, total grain inspected in the Pacific Northwest (PNW) was
9 percent above the 5-year average. Compared with this time last year,
third quarter PNW inspections were up for corn, wheat, and soybeans.
According to USDA/FGIS, total grain inspected for export at the East
Coast and Great Lakes ports totaled 1.16 million metric tons during the
third quarter, down 13 percent from this time last year and 38 percent
Total PNW Gulf East/G. from the 5-year average. Total grain exports to China to date are up
Lakes significantly (122 percent) from this time last year due to greater
demand, but exports to Japan and Canada are down 7 and 5 percent
from last year. Total grain exports to Mexico are up 5 percent.

Johnny. Hill@usda.gov

Source: USDA/FGIS

KCS Rail Acquisition Updates: In an October 8 decision, the Surface Transportation Board (STB) suspended the procedural schedule
involving Kansas City Southern Railway’s (KCS) request to gain regulatory approval to control the Texas Mexican Railway Company
(Tex Mex), a wholly owned subsidiary of Mexrail, Inc. On September 30, Transportaciéon Ferroviaria Mexicana (TFM) exercised its right
under the acquisition agreement to repurchase from KCS the 51 percent of Mexrail stock that had been placed into an independent voting
trust pending STB approval of the acquisition. On August 29, KCS began a 60-day negotiation period to save the transaction, which will
be followed, if necessary, by binding arbitration. STB will reinstate the procedural schedule at such time as KCS demonstrates that there
is a reasonable likelihood it will be able to acquire control of Tex Mex. USDA supported KCS’ application to acquire Tex Mex because it
would increase rail-to-rail competition by creating a third major railroad serving the corridor from the Central Plains to Mexico.
Marvin.Prater@usda.gov

Transportation Unable To Keep Up with ND Grain Harvest. Large soybean and corn crops, combined with a shortage of railcars and
an early fall harvest, have resulted in grain being stored outside, which creates a potential for loss depending on weather conditions. Jon
Mielke of the North Dakota Public Service Commission says the agency has approved 15 million bushels of emergency storage this year.
To improve customer service, Burlington Northern Santa Fe Railway has added 2,200 cars to the grain fleet since August and has also
leased 232 additional locomotives. (The Forum, Fargo, ND). Marvin. Prater@usda.gov, Johnny.Hill@usda.gov

Report is prepared by Deen Olowolayemo, Johnny Hill, Karl Hacker and Delmy Salin, Agricultural Economists, Transportation & Marketing, Agricultural Marketing Service, USDA (202)
690-1304. Support provided by Upper Great Plains Transportation Institute, North Dakota State University. This report can be found on the Internet at www.ams.usda.gov/tmd/grain.htm. E-
mail comments and questions to Suraiudeen.Olowol_ayemo(a)usda o0V .

The United States Department of Agriculture (USDA) prohibits discrimination in all its programs and activities on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, political
beliefs, sexual orientation or marital or family status. (Not all prohibited bases apply to all programs). Persons with disabilities who require alternative means for communication of program
information (Braille, large print, audiotape, etc.) should contact the USDA’s TARGET Center at (202)720-2600. To file a complaint, write USDA, Director of Civil Rights, Room 326-W,
Whitten Building, 14" and Independence Avenue, SW, Washington, DC, 20250-9410, or call (202) 720-5964 (voice and TDD). USDA is an equal opportunity provider and employer.
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Table 1-- Market update: U.S. origins to export position price spreads (per bushel)

Commodity Origin--Destination This week Last week
Corn IL -- Gulf -0.56 -0.53
Corn NE -- Gulf -0.61 -0.57
Soybean IA -- Gulf -0.65 -0.65
HRW KS -- Gulf -0.69 -0.69
HRS ND -- Portland -1.10 -1.34

The Grain Bid Summary illustrates the market relationships for commodities. Positive and negative adjustments in
differential between terminal and futures markets, and the relationship to inland market points, are indicators of
changes in fundamental market supply and demand. The map may be used to monitor market and time differentials.

Figure 1. Grain Bid Summary
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RAIL TRANSPORTATION

Table 2--Rail deliveries to port (carloads)

Mississippi Gulf* Texas Gulf Pacific Northwest _Atlantic & East Gulf Total
Week Ending:
10/15/03 654 1,848 3,602 148 6,252
10/22/03 659 1,010 3,477 807 5,953
2003 YTD 12,771 67,620 115,744 12,497 208,632
2002 YTD 9,451 73,435 82,792 16,552 182,230
% 2002 YTD 135% 92% 140% 76% 114%
Total 2002 11,127 85,822 113,857 21,562 232,368
Total 2001 10,022 81,804 111,376 26,604 229,806

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA; (*) Incomplete Data

Figure 2. Rail Deliveries to Port
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Figure 3. Total U.S. Grain Car Loadings for Class I Railroads
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Table 3--Class I rail carrier grain car bulletin_(Grain carloads originated) _
East : West U.S. Total Canada
CSXT NS BNSF  KCS UP ! CN CP
10/18/03 3,414 3,902 9,754 573 6,784 24,427 4,275 3,641
This Week Last Year 3,181 3,345 9,547 514 6,922 23,509 3,360 4,815
2003 YTD 109,903 130,329 310,616 17,696 267,599 836,143 146,666 149,792
2002 YTD 110,026 127,203 305,590 21,521 269,423 833,763 157,906 152,561
% 2002 YTD 100% 102% 102% 82% 99% 100% 93% 98%
2002 Total 142,760 164,745 400,179 27,161 344,296 1,079,141 191,835 195,765
U.S. rail covered hopper cars online index*
Sep-03 94.6 99 4 94 .4 95.5 95.6 95.7

Source: Association of American Railroads; *Base Year =2001, Index based on Number of Covered Hopper Cars Online (available for Service).

ll,/

Table 4—Tariff rail rates for unit train shipments

P T TON

Date Rate Rate per Rate/per
effective  Commodity Origin Destination per car MT bushel*
10/06/03 Wheat Kansas City, MO Galveston, TX $1,820 $20.06 $0.55
10/06/03 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $4,148 $45.72 $1.24
10/06/03 Wheat St. Louis, MO Houston, TX $1,945 $21.44 $0.58
10/06/03 Wheat Kansas City, MO Laredo, TX $2,280 $25.13 $0.68
10/06/03 Wheat Chicago, IL Albany, NY $1,834 $20.22 $0.55
10/06/03 Corn Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,130 $34.50 $0.88
10/06/03 Corn Chicago, IL Baton Rouge, LA $2,736 $30.16 $0.77
10/06/03 Corn Council Bluffs, IA Baton Rouge, LA $2,170 $23.92 $0.61
10/06/03 Corn Evansville, IN Raleigh, NC $1,886 $20.79 $0.53
10/06/03 Corn Des Moines, TA Laredo, TX $2,864 $31.57 $0.80
10/06/03 Soybean Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,110 $34.28 $0.93
10/06/03  Soybeans Chicago, IL Baton Rouge, LA $2,736 $30.16 $0.82
10/06/03 Soybeans Council Bluffs, IA Baton Rouge, LA $2,799 $30.85 $0.84
10/06/03 Soybeans Des Moines, TA Laredo, TX $2,864 $31.57 $0.86
10/06/03 Soybeans Evansville, IN Raleigh, NC $1,886 $20.79 $0.57

Sources: www.bnsf.com, www.cpr.ca, Www.CcSX.COm, Www.upIr.com

* Approximate load per car = 100 tons: Corn 56 Ibs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 Ibs/bu*
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Table S—Secondary rail car market,
Average premium/discount to tariff, $/car - last week

Delivery Period
Dec-03 Jan-04 Feb-04 Mar-04
BNSF-GF $46 $4 $4 $4
UP-Pool $19 $6 $2 $2

Sources: James B. Joiner & Co.; Tradewest Brokerage Co.
GF=Guaranteed Freight, Pool=Guaranteed Pool

Bids listed are market INDICATORS only & are NOT
guaranteed prices, missing value=No Bid Quoted

Note:

Rail service may be ordered directly from the
railroad via Auction for guaranteed service or tariff
for non-guaranteed setvice, or through the
secondary market. The Secondary Rail Market
information reflects trade values for service that was
originally purchased from the railroad carrier as
some form of guaranteed freight. The auction and
secondary rail values are indicators of rail service
quality and demand/supply.

Table 6--Railroad car ‘Auction’ results
Average premium/discount to tariff, $/car - last auction

Delivery for:

Dec-03 Jan-04 Feb-04
COT/N. Grain no bid $0 $0
COT/S. Grain no bid no bid no bid
GCAS/Region 1 no bid no bid no bid
GCAS/Region 2 $1 no bid no bid

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA.
COT=Certificate of Transportation, GCAS=Grain Car Allocation System
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BARGE TRANSPORTATION
Figure 5. Illinois River Barge Rate Index - Rate Quotes
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Calculating Barge Rate Per Ton: Table 7-- Barge rate quotes: Southbound barge freight
Tndex X 1976 Tariff Benchmark Index=percent of tariff, based on 1976 tariff benchmark rate
Rate per Ton Location 10/22/03 10/15/03 Nov ‘03 Jan ‘04
Select applicable index from market TV.Vm C’m?s o 303 270 291 nq
quotes included in tables on this Mid-Mississippi 305 266 244 nq
page. The 1976 benchmark rates Ilinois River 304 268 232 201
per ton are provided in map below. St. Louis 300 253 196 144
Lower Ohio 288 248 210 152
Cairo-Memphis 277 216 192 135

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA

Table 8—Barge futures market
Southbound barge freight nominal/cash basis values
Index=percent of tariff, based on 1976 tariff benchmark rate

Figure 6. Benchmark Tariff Rates
Week Contract Rate
ended River/region period futures cash
10/28/03 St. Louis Nov. n/a 300
Jan. n/a 160
Mar. n/a 160
Apr. n/a 150
May. n/a 145
Illinois River Nov. n/a 305
Jan. n/a 215
Mar. n/a 175
Apr. n/a 165
May. n/a 155
Source: St. Louis Merchants Exchange
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Figure 7. Barge Movements on the Mississippi River (Lock 27)
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Table 9--Barge grain movements (1,000 tons)
Week ending 10/18/03 Corn Wht Sybn Total
Mississippi River
Rock Island, IL (L15) 171 2 189 361
Winfield, MO (L25) 175 6 224 406
Alton, IL (L26) 341 6 353 700
Granite City, IL (L27) 323 6 365 694
Illinois River (L8) 125 0 89 214
Ohio River (L52) 50 10 42 102
Arkansas River (L1) 0 27 7 102
2003 YTD 22,662 2,409 6,435 32,103
2002 YTD 27,606 2,207 8,352 39,461
% 2002 YTD 82% 109% 77% 81%
2002 Total 35,066 2,590 11,634 50,810

Source: U.S. Army Corp of Engineers
YTD and Calendar year total includes Miss/27, Ohio/52 and Ark/1.
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TRUCK TRANSPORTATION
Figure 8. Weekly U.S. Retail Road Diesel Price
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Figure 9. Weekly Brent Crude Price, Friday Close
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Source: Energy Information Administration, U.S. Department of Energy

Table 10--Crude oil prices (US$ per Barrel)-10/21/03

Type This week Last week Change
Light Sweet Crude (NYMEX) 29.18 30.00 \/
Brent Crude 28.88 29.59  /

Source: U.S. Department of Energy, www.eia.doe.gov; “U.S. Refiner Crude
Acquisition Cost, Composite Domestic & Import
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GRAIN
EXPORTS
Table 11--U.S. export balances (1,000 Metric Tons)
Wheat Corn  Soybean Total
Unshipped export balance HRW SRW HRS SWW DUR All Wheat y
10/16/03 2,131 458 1,052 831 143 4,615 9,062 10,621 24,298
This Week Year Ago 1,608 670 1,641 917 103 4,939 6,584 7,783 19,306
Cumulative Exports-Crop Year

2003/04 YTD 4,673 1,628 2,764 1,508 514 11,088 5,581 2,220 18,889
2002/03 YTD 3,348 1,138 2,667 1,221 383 8,756 4,660 2,015 15,431
% 2002/03 YTD 140% 143% 104% 124% 134% 127% 120% 1 122%
2001/02 Total 8,761 5,485 5,582 3,175 1,133 24,135 48,003 29,926 102,064
2000/01 Total 9,314 4,445 5,775 5,156 1,130 25,819 47,734 27,567 101,120

Source: Foreign Agricultural Service/USDA; YTD: Year-to-Date;

Crop Year: Wheat=5/31-6/01, Corn & Soybeans=9/01-8/31

Includes Wheat, Corn, and Soybean Sales

Figure 10. U.S. Grain, Unshipped Export Balance
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Table 12--Select U.S. port regions - grain inspections for export (1,000 metric tons)

Date Pacific Region Mississippi Gulf Texas Gulf Port Region Total
Wheat Corn SoybniWheat Corn SoybniWheat Corn Soybn: Pacific  Mississippi Texas

10/23/03 273 118 249 89 784 676 130 0 0 639 1,548 130
2003 YTD 7,357 4,314 3,571 5,048 24,11312,781 5,462 580 56 15,242 41,942 6,098
2002 YTD 7,333 3,084 2,083 4,747 30,86112,902 4,932 259 365 12,500 48,510 5,557
% 2002 YTD 100% 140% 171% 106% 78% 99% 111% 223% 15% 122% 86% 110%

2002 Total 9,128 3,994 2,870 5,670 36,383 18,549 5,875 266 373 15,992 60,602 6,514

Source: Federal Grain Inspection Service = YTD-Year-to-Date

Figure 11. U.S. Grain Inspected for Export
Includes Wheat, Corn, and Soybeans
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Figure 12. Gulf Port Grain Vessel Loading
Past 7 Days
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Table 13--Weekly port region grain ocean vessel activity (number of vessels)

Date Gulf Pacific Vancouver
Northwest B.C.
Loaded Due Next
In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port In Port

10/16/03 38 56 82 11 8

10/23/03 40 61 84 11 12
2002 Range (15..55) (33..66) (44..82) (3..15) (0..12)
2002 Avg 35 51 65 8 5

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/ USDA

Table 14--Quarterly ocean freight rates (average rates & percentage changes, U.S. dollars/metric ton)

2003 2002  Change 2003 2002 Change
3Qr  3MQtr % | 39Qtr Y Qtr %
Gulf to i Pacific NW to
Japan  $33.83 $19.54 73% Japan - $11.57 -
Mexico - $7.25 - Taiwan $19.50  $11.21 73%
Taiwan  $33.00 - -

N. Europe  $22.88 - - | Argentina/Brazil to
N. Africa  $25.50 $13.50 89% Med. Sea $33.38  $19.93 67%
Med. Sea  $24.88 $11.92 109% N. Europe $22.50  $18.65 21%

China $34.75 - -
Source: Transportation & Marketing/ AMS/USDA
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Figure 13. Grain Vessel Rates, U.S. to Japan
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Table 15--Ocean freight rates for selected shipments
Week Ending 10/25/03
. . . Volume loaded Freight rate
Export region Import region Grain Month (Tons) ($/ton)
U.S. Gulf Adriatic Hvy Grain Oct 28/31 36,000 $28.50
U.S. Gulf Ghana Wheat Oct 20/30 15,000 $42.65*
U.S. Gulf Taiwan Hvy Grain Nov 5/18 44000/46000 $44.00
U.S. Gulf Japan Hvy Grain Nov 1/10 42,000/44,000 $38.80
U.S. Gulf Japan Hvy Grain Oct 20/30 54,000 $37.00
U.S. Gulf China Hvy Grain Oct 25/Nov 5 55,000 $45.00

Source: Maritime Research Inc.

Rates shown are for metric ton (2,204.62 1bs.=one metric ton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicated; op=option

"Most food aid from the United States is required to be shipped on U.S. flag vessels. The vessels are of limited availability resulting
in higher rates. In addition, destinations receiving food aid generally lack adequate port unloading facilities, requiring the vessel to

remain in port for a longer duration than normal.
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CONTAINER

Container Ocean Freight Rates

Average rate per twenty-equivalent-unit (TEU), weighed by shipping line market share
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA, Quarterly Updates

Figure 14. Container Rates - Soybeans
Seattle, WA Origin to Tokyo, Japan
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Figure 15. Container Rates - Feed Grain
Seattle, WA Origin to Selected Destinations
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