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Bid/Offer for up to 6 Months of Trading
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Rail Car ‘Auction’ Offerings
Ddlivery for: Aug-02 Sep-02
Offered % Sold Offered % Sold
BNSF-COT 12,966 19% 11,820 68%
UP-GCAS 5,400 10% 5,400 3%
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA; www.bnsf.com; www.uprr.com
Secondary Rail Car Market
Average PremiunvDiscount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Week
Railroad Car ‘Auction’ Results

Delivery Period
Jul-02 Aug-02 Sep-02 Oct-02

BNSF-GF $2 $6 $21 $36

UP-Pool $(6) $2) $6 $20

Source: T& M/AMS/USDA. Datafrom Atwood/ConAgra., Harvest States

Co-op, James B. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.;
GF=Guaranteed Freight, GEEP=Guaranteed Eqpt. Exchange,
Pool=Guaranteed Pool

note... bids listed are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guaranteed
prices, missing value=No Bid Quoted

Southbound Bar ge Freight Nominal/Cash Basis Values
Index=Percent of Tariff, Based on 1976 Tariff Benchmark Rate

Délivery for:
COT/N. Grain

COT/S. Gran

GCAS/Region 2
GCAS/Region 4

Aug-02
$2

$0

no bid
no bid

Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Auction

Sep-02

$12

no bid

no offer

no offer

Oct-02
$0

no bid

no offer

no offer

Source: T& M/AMS USDA. Data from www.bnsf.com, www.uprr.com,
COT=Certificate of Transportation; GCAS=Grain Car Allocation

Rate
Contract

Week ended River/Region Period Futures Cash
07/2/02 St Louis Jul 0 115
Sept 0 175

Nov 0 155

Dec 0 135

Jan 0 135

Illinois River Jul 0 150

Sept 0 188

Nov 0 170

Dec 0 163

Jan 0 185

Source: St. Louis Merchants Exchange

Weekly Retail Diesel (Road) Prices (Including Taxes)

$1.80

$1.70

$1.60 M

oo N
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Source: Energy U.S. of Energy

US$/Gallon

$0.90

01/31/00
07/17/00

01/05/98
03/30/98
06/22/98
09/14/98
12/07/98
03/01/99
05/24/99
08/16/99

Date

Southbound Barge Freight Spot Rates
6/26/02 6/19/02 Jul ‘02 Sep ‘02

Twin Cities 203 181 199 230
Mid-Mississippi 165 151 166 201
Illinois River 151 138 154 191
St. Louis 105 96 112 175
Lower Ohio 108 96 127 189
Cairo-Memphis 98 90 106 169

Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA

Ng=no quote;

Lewiston

Barge Benchmark Tariff Rates
Est. 1976 - 'Tariff No. 7'
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Grain Car Loadingsfor Class| Railroads

. . N Carloads
Class | Railroad Grain Car Loadings 5000
5,
Week Ending: Carloads — Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.
6/8/02 v | 7" 3-yr Avg of Carloads for Week
6/15/02 18,927 i
6/22/02 19855 | 0 [ ‘.\ /‘ 1)
\ | i ,
Year to Date - 2002 513,997 \\\ [/ ", “‘U \ f\ /»\
Year to Date - 2001 524,582 I H /\ Cfa /W { A\
25000 |- | \ \ ‘ | ‘\\ . \\‘ N \(\ ' ‘( ! “‘ f/\‘ A“» N {(W )
Total 2001 1,117,601 \‘\ N ‘ (R A o It H’ \ Jc \ A
Total 2000 1,188,917 | ‘m | /\g ‘H | &\ Nf‘/ | Vi \ [ ‘1;" | H J‘M\\
‘ A | L/ VT (R WY A U I P i
| | U \ UYL ¥ Vi V\ !
Source: Association of American Railroads | \ U/ ! \q \m’ \ N“N‘ \ \\\
20,000 |- \ I V \
y v U \
15,000
S 8 3388 g3 g5 I8 sy 3
Class| Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin
Grain Carloads Originated
East West Canada
CSXT NS BNSF KCS upP CN CP
06/22/02 2,579 2,880 7,074 584 6,738 3,806 4,082
ThisWeek Last Year 2,842 3,028 6,817 443 6,001 4,732 4,396
2002 YTD 70,725 77,961 180,807 14,207 166,142 101,842 89,992
2001 YTD 77,072 77,703 195,445 11,238 163,124 121,146 110,805
2001 Total 151,864 163,018 428,603 26,330 347,156 254,982 232,461
2000 Total 147,708 153,905 425,849 26,515 364,785 160,749 239,670
Source: Association of American Railroads
Tariff Rail Ratesfor Unit Train Shipments
June 2002
Date Tariff Rate Rate Per Rate/Per
Effective Item Commaodity Origin Destination Per Car MT Bushel*
06/03/02 45560 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $2,050 $22.60 $0.62
06/03/02 43521 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,877 $42.74 $1.16
06/03/02 46540 Wheat Kansas City, MO Houston, TX $1,650 $18.19 $0.50
06/03/02 43586 Wheat Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $4,347 $47.92 $1.30
06/03/02 43581 Wheat Omaha, NE Portland, OR $4,005 $44.15 $1.20
06/03/02 31040 Corn Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR NA $0.00 $0.00
06/03/02 31035 Corn Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $2,700 $29.76 $0.76
06/03/02 31040 Corn Omaha, NE Portland, OR NA $0.00 $0.00
06/03/02 61180 Soybean Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR NA $0.00 $0.00
06/03/02 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR NA $0.00 $0.00
05/01/98 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,780 $25.23 $0.83

Source: www.bnsf.com
Approximate load per car = 100 tons: Corn 56 lbs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 |bs/bu
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(*) Incomplete Data

Barge Movements - Locks 27
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Rail Deliveriesto Port

[l Pacific Northwest
[ Texas Gulf

8,000
i
6,000

4,000

2,000

Rail Deliveriesto Port
Carloads 12,000
Mississippi Texas Pacific Atlantic &

Gulf Gulf  Northwest East Gulf 10,000
Week Ending:
05/22/02 152* 1,521 1,709 138 ;;‘;’
05/29/02 103 1375 1742 406 g
06/05/02 12* 1,631 1,725 528 E%
06/12/02 206* 1,397 991 314 %
06/19/02 246* 1,985 1,015 56 g
06/26/02 152* 1,368 2,036 303 S
YTD 2002 6,246* 46,572 49,661 11,886
YTD 2001 5,234 40,079 54,300 14,437
Total 2001 10,022 81,804 111,376 26,604
Total 2000 25,767 104,473 128,414 14,816
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMSUSDA

B wmississippi Gulf  —|

| |

‘ |
i N o
M il

i
|

Barge Grain Movements
| for week ending 6/22/02

Corn Wht Sybn Total
1,000 Tons

Mississippi River
Rock Island, IL (L15) 390 3 108 502
Winfield, MO (L25) 652 11 137 800
Alton, IL (L26) 1,023 13 183 1,225
Granite City, IL (L27) 1,020 18 194 1241

[llinoisRiver (L8) 308 5 41 360

Ohio (L52) n‘a n‘a n‘a n/‘a

Arkansas (L1) 0 33 3 36
2002 YTD 16,805 1,026 5,182 23,846
2001 YTD 13228 945 4,672 19,873
Total 2001 31,878 2,679 10,616 47,091
Total 2000 33482 2518 10,327 48,247

MissYTD: Caendar year totals include Miss/27, Ohio/52 and Ark/1.
Source: U.S. Army Corp of Engineers; L15 & L25 closed for winter.
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U.S. Export Balances (1,000 Metric Tons)
Wheat Corn Soybean Total
HRW SKRW HRS SWMW DUR All

Unshipped Exports-Crop Y ear
06/20/02 1,116 373 869 498 138 2,993 7,152 3,505 13,650
ThisWeek Year Ago 948 593 747 471 219 2,978 7,448 1,932 12,358
Cumulative Exports-Crop Y ear
01/02YTD 401 158 210 233 26 1,027 37,922 26,614 65,563
00/01YTD 476 203 273 144 50 1,146 36,138 17,713 54,997
99/00 Total 9,858 4,710 6,305 5413 1,232 27,518 37,220 24,516 89,254
98/99 Tota 7,387 3,645 7,864 6,105 963 25,965 44,476 24,501 94,942
Source: Foreign Agricultural Service Y TD-Y ear-to-Date (www.fas.usda.gov) Crop Y ear:Wheat=5/31-6/01, Corn & Soybeans=9/01-8/31

Select U.S. Port Regions - Grain | nspectionsfor Export - 1,000 Metric Tons

Pacific Region Mississippi Gulf Texas Gulf
Wheat Corn Soybean Wheat Corn  Soybean Wheat Corn  Soybean

06/27/02 85 0 4 103 603 180 0 0

2002 YTD 3,947 2,072 1,243 2,671 18,641 9,004 3,012 138 788

2001 YTD 4,901 2,224 1,246 2,676 15,655 8,203 2,759 165 780

% of Last Year 40% 34% 73% 39% 53% 50% 29% 78%

2000 Total 9,946 6,006 1,710 6,776 35231 17,953 6,927 470 1,008

Source: Federal Grain Inspection Service Y TD-Y ear-to-Date

110,000

100,000

U.S. Grain Inspected for Export

Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.
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Select Canadian Ports - Export | nspections
1,000 Metric Tons, Crop Y ear

Week Ended: 6/20/02

Vancouver

Prince Rupert
Prairie Direct
Thunder Bay
St. Lawrence

2001 YTD Exports
2000 YTD Exports

% of Last Year

Wheat Durum Barley
5,592 372 476
1,100
1,147 393 353
594 277 107
2,233 1,921 0
10,666 2,963 961
11,451 3,028 1,753
93% 98% 55%

Source: Canadian Grains Commission, Crop year 8/1-7/31
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Vessels
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Gulf Region
Vessels Loaded
- Past 7 Days-

12/25/97

04/23/98

08/20/98

12/17/98

04/15/99

08/12/99

12/09/99

04/06/00

08/03/00

11/30/00

03/29/01

07/26/01

11/22/01

03/21/02

Port Region Ocean Grain Vessals
Gulf Pacific Northwest Vancouver, B.C.
Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next
In Port 7-Days  10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days  10-Days
06/20/02 37 51 63 4 2 7 5
06/27/02 27 40 65 11 8 4 2
2001 Range (13..65) (28..64) (46..81) (1..18) (4..20) (3..19) (0..7)
2000 Range (23.50) (34..57) (47..83) (4..15) (4..20) (5..19) (0..9)
2001 Avg 36 48 63 12 8 3
2000 Avg 36 49 65 11 9 3
1999 Avg 32 52 65 10 9 3
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/ USDA

Container Ocean Freight Rates
Monthly Weighted Averages Based on Shipping Line Monthly Mkt. Share

Rate per TEU
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Container Rates - Feed Grain
Seattle, WA Origin to Selected Destinations
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—— Rate - Gulf to Japan
—-— Rate - PNW to Japan
I Spread - Gulf vs. PNW to Japan

US$/Metric Ton
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Quarterly Ocean
Freight Rates

Quarterly Ocean Freight Rates

Average Rates & Percentage Changes, U.S. DollarsgMetric Ton - Basis

2002 2001 % 2002 2001 %
1st Qtr 1stQtr  Change 1stQtr  1st Qtr Change
Gulf to Pacific NW to
Japan $18.10 $2170 -16% | Japan $11.13 $16.36 -31%
Mexico $31.49 -
Venezuela $13.53 - i
N. Europe $10.67 $15.19 -29% Argentinato
N. Africa $17.58 $26.25 -33% : Med. Sea $17.85 $22.14 -19%
Med. Sea $10.97 $14.81 -25% N. Europe $13.48 $16.47 -18%
Black Sea $49.12 - : Japan $25.59 $30.51 -16%
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AM S/USDA; (*) rates shown ar.e for metric ton (2,204.62 |bs.=one metric ton)
Ocean Freight Rates (Select L ocations) - week ending 6/29/02
Volume L oaded Freight Rate
Export Region Import Region Grain Month (Tons) ($Ton)
Gulf Latvia Wheat Flour (Bgd) Aug 20/25 7,020 $83.61
Gulf Casablanca Heavy Grain Jun 25/30 30,000 $17.00
Gulf Congo Grains (Bgd) Jul 25/30 4,500 $82.00
Gulf Durban (S. Africa) Heavy Grain Jul /10 25,000 $19.00
Gulf Mombasa (Kenya) Grains (Bgd) Jul 1/10 6,950 $171.00
Gulf Tawan Heavy Grain Jul 10/20 56,000 $17.35
Gulf Japan Heavy Grain Jul /15 54,000 $18.25
Gulf Japan Heavy Grain Jul 29/Aug 9 54,000 $18.25
Paranagua France Pellets Jun 21/25 55,000 $11.00
Romania Tunisia Wheat Jun 30/ 25,000 $13.40
Source: Maritime Research Inc.; rates shown are for metric ton (2,204.62 Ibs.=one metric ton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicated; op=option




