
GRAIN TRANSPORTATION REPORT
Agricultural Marketing Service

United States Department of Agriculture

    JANUARY 2, 2002

Jan. 6-9  American Farm Bureau Annual Meeting Reno, NV 202-484-3600 (ph)
847-685-8600 (ph)

Jan. 12-18 Wheat Industry Conference Orlando, FL 202-547-7800 (ph)
202-898-0522 (fax)
wheatworld@wheatworld.org

Jan. 13  Transportation Research Board (TRB) Washington, DC Robert Spicher
 81st Annual Meeting 202-334-2934 (ph)

www.national-academies.org/trb

Jan. 21& 22 Agriculture Ocean Transportation Coalition Portland, OR (1/21) 202-467-8380 (ph)
(AgOTC) Pacific Northwest Workshops Boise, ID (1/22) 202-467-8381 (fax)

Jan. 30-31 Maritime Security 2002 Washington, DC Jane Poterala
212-620-7209 (ph)
212-633-1165 (fax)

Feb. 4-6 U.S. Grains Council Dallas, TX 202-789-0789 (ph)
Annual Membership Meeting 202-898-0522 (fax)

grains@grains.org

Feb. 20-22 American Association of Port Cape Canaveral, FL 703-684-5700 (ph)
Authorities (AAPA): Congestion and 703-684-6321 (fax)
Capacity Planning for Growth

Feb. 21-22 Agricultural Outlook Forum 2002 Washington, DC 202-720-3050 (ph)

Feb. 21-23 American Soybean Association/ Nashville, TN 314-275-9915 (ph)
National Corn Growers Association 314-275-7061 (fax)
Commodity Classic

Feb. 12-13 Transportation Intermediaries Association Dallas, TX 703-317-2140 (ph)
(TIA) Annual Convention & Trade Show 703-329-1898 (fax)

Mar. 1-4 (n) National Farmers Union 100th Anniversary Irving, TX Laura Johnston
Convention and Trade Show 202-314-3104 (ph)

www.nfu.org

Mar. 2-5 Grain Elevator & Processing Society Vancouver, B.C. 612-339-4625 (ph)
Exchange Exhibition (GEAPS) 612-339-4644 (fax)

Info@geaps.com

Mar. 17-20 NGFA 106th Annual Convention Hilton Head, SC 202-289-0873
http://www.ngfa.org/

Apr. 21-24 U.S. Geological Survey Conference: South Sioux City, NE 402-471-5555 (ph)
“Missouri River Science: Meeting the zuerlein@ngpc.state.ne.us
Challenge of Change”

(n)=newly added  

Report is prepared by Karl Hacker and Sigal Nissan, Agricultural Economists, Transportation & Marketing, Agricultural Marketing Service, USDA  (202) 690-1304.   Report design by Kimberly Vachal, Upper Great Plains
Transportation Institute, North Dakota State University.    This report can be found on the Internet at www.ams.usda.gov/tmd/grain.htm.  E-mail comments to Karl.Hacker@usda.gov .

The United States Department of Agriculture (USDA) prohibits discrimination in all its programs and activities on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, political beliefs, sexual orientation or
marital or family status.  (Not all prohibited bases apply to all programs).  Persons with disabilities who require alternative means for communication of program information  (Braille, large print, audiotape, etc.) should contact
the USDA’s TARGET Center at (202)720-2600.  To file a complaint, write USDA, Director of Civil Rights, Room 326-W, Whitten Building, 14 th and Independence Avenue, SW, Washington, DC, 20250-9410, or call (202)
720-5964 (voice and TDD).  USDA is an equal opportunity provider and employer.
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$0=Tariff Rate

Secondary Rail Market Bids
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Peoria
Cincinnati        
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Memphis    
3.14

Greenville     
2.29

Lewiston

4.81
Barge Benchmark Tariff Rates

Est. 1976 - 'Tariff No. 7'

    
4.04

Owensboro

Rail Car ‘Auction’ Offerings 

Delivery for: Feb-02 Apr-02
Offered % Sold Offered % Sold

BNSF-COT 11,512 2% 12,234 1%

UP-GCAS 5,400 0% 5,400 0%
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA; www.bnsf.com; www.uprr.com

Secondary Rail Car Market 
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Week

Delivery Period
Jan-02 Feb-02 Mar-02 Apr-02

BNSF-GF $22 $4 $(1) $(21)

UP-Pool $2 $(14) $(19) $(29)

Source: T&M/AMS/USDA.  Data from Atwood/ConAgra., Harvest States Co-op,
James B. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.;

GF=Guaranteed Freight, GEEP=Guaranteed Eqpt. Exchange, Pool=Guaranteed Pool

note... bids listed are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guaranteed prices,
missing value=No Bid Quoted

Railroad Car ‘Auction’ Results 
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Auction

Delivery for: Feb-02 Mar-02 Apr-02

COT/N. Grain no bid no bid no bid

COT/S. Grain no bid no bid no bid

GCAS/Region 2 no bid no bid no bid

GCAS/Region 4 no bid no bid no bid
Source: T&M/AMS USDA.  Data from www.bnsf.com,  www.uprr.com, 
(COT=Certificate of Transportation; GCAS=Grain Car Allocation System)

Southbound Barge Freight Nominal/Cash Basis Values
Index=Percent of Tariff, Based on 1976 Tariff Benchmark Rate

Week
ended River/Region

Contract
Period

  Rate

Futures Cash

12/31/01 St. Louis

Illinois River

Jan
Mar
May
Jul

Sept
Jan
Mar
May
Jul

Sept

 128 
 128 
 136 

 0 
 0 

 193 
 170 

 0 
 0 
 0 

 150 
 145 
 145 
145
 0 

 208 
  170  

160
0

 0 
  

Source:  St. Louis Merchants Exchange

Southbound Barge Freight Spot Rates

12/26/01 12/19/01 Jan ‘02 Mar ‘02
Twin Cities 0 0 0 0
Mid-Mississippi 0 0 0 0
Illinois River 195 167 193 171
St. Louis 143 130 140 138
Lower Ohio 152 137 151 144
Cairo-Memphis 131 119 133 129
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA 
nq=no quote;   
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Carloads

Grain Car Loadings for Class I Railroads

Class I Railroad Grain Car Loadings

Week Ending: Carloads
12/8/01 23,091

12/15/01 21,926
12/22/01 22,854

Year to Date - 2001 1,102,898
Year to Date - 2000 1,174,008

Total 2000 1,188,917
Total 1999 1,270,375

Source:  Association of American Railroads

Class I Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin
Grain Carloads Originated

East West Canada
Conrail CSXT IC NS BNSF KCS UP CN CP

12/22/01 0 3,137 0 3,518 8,212 740 7,247 5,797 4,632

This Week Last Year 0 2,529 0 2,609 8,150 329 5,628 3,782 4,469

2001 YTD 0 150,458 0 161,035 423,237 25,882 342,286 251,565 230,365

2000 YTD 0 145,693 70,155 151,606 419,936 26,224 360,394 157,827 237,179

2000 Total 0 147,708 70,155 153,905 425,849 26,515 364,785 160,749 239,670

1999 Total 15,522 132,157 88,056 138,379 465,088 33,911 398,262 121,381 206,328
       Source: Association of American Railroads

Tariff Rail Rates for Unit Train Shipments
December 2001
Date 
Effective

Tariff 
Item Commodity Origin Destination

Rate
Per Car

Rate Per
MT

Rate/Per
Bushel*

12/03/01 45560 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $2,050 $22.60 $0.62
12/03/01 43521 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,877 $42.74 $1.16
12/03/01 46540 Wheat Kansas City, MO Houston, TX $1,650 $18.19 $0.50
12/03/01 43586 Wheat Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $4,240 $46.74 $1.27
12/03/01 43581 Wheat Omaha, NE Portland, OR $3,905 $43.04 $1.17
12/03/01 31040 Corn Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR NA $0.00 $0.00
12/03/01 31035 Corn Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $2,700 $29.76 $0.76
12/03/01 31040 Corn Omaha, NE Portland, OR NA $0.00 $0.00
12/03/01 61180 Soybean Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $2,730 $30.09 $0.82
12/03/01 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,480 $27.34 $0.74
05/01/98 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,780 $25.23 $0.83
Source: www.bnsf.com
Approximate load per car = 100 tons: Corn 56 lbs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 lbs/bu
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Pacific Northwest
Texas Gulf
Mississippi Gulf

Rail Deliveries to Port
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Soybeans
Wheat
Corn

Barge Movements - Locks 27

Rail Deliveries to Port
Carloads

Mississippi
Gulf

Texas 
Gulf

Pacific
Northwest

Atlantic &
East Gulf

Week Ending:
11/14/01   206* 2,290 1,954 313

11/21/01   202* 2,246 2,377 949

11/28/01   7* 1,702 1,638 535

12/05/01   230* 2,307 1,717 605

12/12/01   137*   2,081* 1,523 643

12/19/01   201* 1,139 1,847 507

YTD 2001   9,963*    79,653* 108,961 26,018

YTD 2000 25,762 103,143 127,036 14,685

Total 2000 25,675 105,308 129,464 14,816

Total 1999 30,038 132,069 161,492 14,446
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA

.
 (*)   Incomplete Data
(**)  Revised Data
  

Barge Grain Movements
for week ending 12/22/01

Corn Wht Sybn Total
1,000 Tons

Mississippi River 
Rock Island, IL (L15) 15 0 2 26

Winfield, MO (L25) 162 2 198 372

Alton, IL (L26) 687 27 458 1,191

Granite City, IL (L27) 682 26 447 1,175

Illinois River  (L8) 431 26 246 703

Ohio (L52) 67 1 48 137

Arkansas (L1) 0 0 0 0
2001 YTD  31,445 2,660 10,249 46,251
2000 YTD 33,198 2,465 10,251 47,774
Total 2000 33,482 2,518 10,327 48,247

Total 1999 36,711 2,883 9,771 51,887

Miss YTD:  Calendar year totals include Miss/27, Ohio/52 and Ark/1.
Source:  U.S. Army Corp of Engineers  
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Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.

U.S. Grain Inspected for Export

U.S. Export Balances (1,000 Metric Tons)
Wheat Corn Soybean Total

HRW SRW HRS SWW DUR All 
Unshipped Exports-Crop Year

12/20/01 1,254 556 965 604 118 3,497 7,596 8,257 19,350

This Week Year Ago 1,057 384 869 742 209 3,260 6,547 6,610 16,417

Cumulative Exports-Crop Year
00/01 YTD 4,826 3,368 3,163 1,861 800 14,017 13,051 11,744 38,812

99/00 YTD 5,648 2,653 3,251 2,868 706 15,126 14,820 17,713 47,659

97/98 Total 9,858 4,710 6,305 5,413 1,232 27,518 37,220 24,516 89,254

96/97 Total 7,387 3,645 7,864 6,105 963 25,965 44,476 24,501 94,942
       Source: Foreign Agricultural Service YTD-Year-to-Date (www.fas.usda.gov) Crop Year:Wheat=5/31-6/01, Corn & Soybeans=9/01-8/31

Select U.S. Port Regions - Grain Inspections for Export - 1,000 Metric Tons
Pacific Region Mississippi Gulf Texas Gulf

Wheat Corn Soybean Wheat Corn Soybean Wheat Corn Soybean
12/27/01 273 114 68 47 692 466 82 0 21

2001 YTD 9,734 5,129 2,778 6,179 34,581 17,439 5,862 267 1,581

2000 YTD 10,007 5,877 1,647 6,829 34,991 17,996 6,984 470 1,008

% of Last Year 98% 85% 162% 91% 98% 97% 85% 57% 157%

1998 Total 10,838 4,373 651 5,048 31,330 14,917 7,270 562 1,392
Source: Federal Grain Inspection Service     YTD-Year-to-Date 

Select Canadian Ports - Export Inspections 
1,000 Metric Tons, Crop Year

Wheat Durum Barley
Week Ended: 12/20/01

Vancouver 2,969 162 257
Prince Rupert 196 0 0
Prairie Direct 521 168 113
Thunder Bay 260 157 21
St. Lawrence 1,294 636 0

2001 YTD Exports 5,240 1,123 391

2000 YTD Exports 4,982 1,347 579

% of Last Year 105% 83% 68%
Source: Canadian Grains Commission, Crop year 8/1-7/31
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 - Past 7 Days-
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Hong Kong Korea Taiwan

Container Rates - Feed Grain
Seattle, WA Origin to Selected Destinations

Port Region Ocean Grain Vessels 
Gulf Pacific Northwest Vancouver, B.C.

Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next
In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days

12/20/01 34 48 63 14 11 5 4

12/27/01 42 49 67 10 8 3 2

1999 Range (14..47) (39..65) (34..80) (6..18) (2..20) (2..15) (0..9)

1998 Range (19..62) (34..64) (40..93) (1..19) (3..14) (0..10)

1999 Avg 32 52 65 9 9 3

1998 Avg 40 48 61 10 9 3

1997 Avg 33 45 58
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/ USDA   

Container Ocean Freight Rates 
Monthly Weighted Averages Based on Shipping Line Monthly Mkt. Share

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA
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Quarterly Ocean 
Freight Rates

Quarterly Ocean Freight Rates
Average Rates & Percentage Changes, U.S. Dollars/Metric Ton - Basis 

2001
3rd Qtr

2000
3rd Qtr

%
Change

2001
3rd Qtr

2000
3rd Qtr

    %    
Change 

Gulf to Pacific NW to
Japan $29.40 $36.42 -19% Japan $10.46 $15.43 -32%

Mexico $16.11 - Red Sea/ Arabian Sea $29.03

Venezuela $13.45 $15.13 -11%

N. Europe $12.06 $15.50 -33% Argentina to
N. Africa $18.21 $34.19 -47% N. Europe

Med. Sea $12.05 $16.59 -27% Japan $16.22 $18.62 -13%

$29.40 $36.42 -19%
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA; (*) rates shown are for metric ton (2,204.62 lbs.=one metric ton) 

Ocean Freight Rates  (Select Locations) - week ending 12/29/01

Export Region Import Region Grain Month
Volume Loaded 

(Tons)
Freight Rate

($Ton)

Gulf Morocco  Heavy Grain Spot 32,000 $16.00
Gulf Japan Heavy Grain Jan 5/6 54,000 $16.40
Rostock (Ger.) Turkey Wheat Jan 10/20 45,000 $8.00
Source: Maritime Research Inc.;  rates shown are for long ton (2,240 lbs.=one long ton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicated; op=option


