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April 18-20 Global Agriculture 2020: Which Way Norwich, U. K. Caroline Websdale
Forward? +44 1603 450641 (ph)
+44 1603 40045/450015 (fax)
April 18-20 Inland Rivers, Ports, & Terminas Baton Rouge, LA Diedre McGowan
Annual Meeting 601-352-4778 (ph)
601-355-1506 (fax)
April 29-May 2 Federa Railroad Administration (FRA): St. Louis, MO Karen McClure
Financing Freight Transportation 202-493-6417 (ph)
I mprovements Conference karen.mcclure@fra.dot.gov
May 7-9 American Feed Industry Association Indianapalis, IN 703-524-0810 (ph)
Feed Industry Show and Educational Forum 703-524-1921 (fax)
afia@afia.org
May 19-26 International Assoc. of Ports and Harbors  Montreal, Can. Marie Jose Moo-Sang
(IAPH) 22™ World Ports Conference 514-283-7038 (ph)

514-283-7019 (fax)

May 20-24 International Wheat Quality Conferencell Manhattan, KS Marsha Grunewald
785-776-2757 (ph)
marsh@usgmrl.ksu.edu

May 22-24 National Agricultural Biotechnology Chicago, IL 217-244-1706 (ph)
Council Conference. High Anxiety and 217-244-1707 (fax)
Biotechnology: Who's Buying, Who's Not nsrl @uiuc.edu
and Why?

June 17-21 Joint Meeting: 118" Annual Seed Trade ~ San Antonio, TX 202-638-3128 (ph)
Assoc. Convention/30" Annual Mexican 202-638-3171 (fax)

Seed Trade Assoc. Convention

June 18-29 Advancesin Agricultural Productionand  Various Locations, USA  256-381-6600 (ph)

Fertilization: U.S. Study Tour 256-381-7408 (fax)
hrdu@IFDC.org
July 22-25 U.S. Grains Council 41 Annual Board of  Portland, OR 202-789-0789 (ph)
Directors Meeting; 3" International Value 202-898-0522 (fax)
Enhanced Grains Conference & Trade Show grains@grains.org

www.grains.org

June 28-29 Pacific Northwest Grain & Feed Assoc. Chelan, WA 503-227-0234 (ph)
84™ Annual Convention 503-227-0059 (fax)
pnwgfal @teleport.com

Report is prepared by Karl Hacker and Sigal Nissan, Agricultural Economists, Transportation & Marketing, Agricultural Marketing Service, USDA (202) 690-1304. Report design by Kimberly Vachal, Upper Great Plains
Transportation Ingtitute, North Dakota State University.  This report can be found on the Internet at www.ams.usda.gov/tmd/grain.ntm. E-mail comments to Karl.Hacker@usda.gov .

The United States Department of Agriculture (USDA) prohibits discrimination in al its programs and activities on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, political beliefs, sexual orientation or marital
or family status. (Not all prohibited bases apply to al programs). Personswith disabilities who require alternative means for communication of program information (Braille, large print, audiotape, etc.) should contact the USDA’s
TARGET Center at (202)720-2600. To file acomplaint, write USDA, Director of Civil Rights, Room 326-W, Whitten Building, 14 ™ and Independence Avenue, SW, Washington, DC, 20250-9410, or call (202) 720-5964 (voice
and TDD). USDA isan equal opportunity provider and employer.
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Rail Car ‘Auction’ Offerings
Délivery for: Apr-01 June-01

Offered % Sold Offered % Sold
BNSF-COT 10,857 15% 12,000 1%
UP-GCAS 5,400 1% 5,400 0%
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMSUSDA; www.bnsf.com; www.uprr.com

Secondary Rail Car Market
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Week

Delivery Period Railroad Car ‘Auction’ Results
Apr-01 May-01 Jun-01 Jul-01 Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Auction

Delivery for: May-01 Jun-01 Jul-01
COT/N. Grain no bid no bid no bid

BNSF-GF $(24) $(25) $(14) $(8)

UP-Pool $(29) $(35) $(32) $(24)
COT/S. Gran no bid no bid no bid

GCAS/Region 2 no bid no bid no offer
Source:  T& M/AMS/USDA. Datafrom Atwood/ConAgra., Harvest States Co-op,

James B. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.; GCAS/Region 4 no bid no bid no offer
GF=Guaranteed Freight, GEEP=Guaranteed Eqpt. Exchange, Pool=Guaranteed Pool

Source: T&* M/AMS USDA. Datafrom www.bnsf.com, www.uprr.com,

note... bids listed are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guaranteed prices,
missing value=No Bid Quoted

Southbound Bar ge Freight Nominal/Cash Basis Values "
Index=Percent of Tariff, Based on 1976 Tariff Benchmark Rate Southbound Bar ge Freight Spot Rates
Rate 3/28/01  3/21/01  April ‘01  June‘0l

Week _ _ Contract Twin Cities 0 0 209 194
ended River/Region Period Futures  Cash Mid-Mississippi 213 208 180 169
04/03/01  St. Louis May 135 135 Illinois River 208 206 171 159

duly 139 150 St. Louis 170 169 144 138

Sept 191 210 .

Nov 163 0 Lower Ohio 173 182 151 147

Jan 153 0 Cairo-Memphis 146 158 138 134

[llinois River May 145 150 Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA

July 156 165 ng=no quote;

Sept 220 228

Nov 181 0

Jan 0 0

Source: St. Louis Merchants Exchange

Weekly Retail Diesel (Road) Prices (Including Taxes)
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Grain Car Loadingsfor Class| Railroads

Carloads

35,000

Source: Association of American Railroads

15,000

Class| Railroad Grain Car Loadings —— Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.
---= 3-yr Avg of Carloads for Week

Week Ending: Carloads
03/10/01 22,976 /‘\

30,000
03/17/01 23,866 W\ \ | \
03/24/01 22,038 w\ /\/ \\‘N\/\ /\J{ ,(\ ‘
Year to Date - 2001 272,879 \V‘ | | \
Y ear to Date - 2000 301,272 25,000 — /

|

Total 2000 1,188,917
Total 1999 1,270,375

20,000

01/25/95

06/21/95

11/15/95

04/10/96

09/11/96

02/01/97

06/28/97

11/22/97

04/18/98

09/12/98

02/06/99

07/03/99

11/27/99

Class| Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin
Grain Carloads Originated

04/22/00

East West Canada

Conrail  CSXT . IC. NS BNSE | KCS UP CN CP
03/24/01 0 2,783 0 2,896 8,958 515 6,886 4,594 4,042
This Week Last Y ear 0 3,397 1,681 2,632 8,245 672 7,556 2,991 4,781
2001 YTD 0 40,797 0 37,984 108,331 5,870 79,897 57,640 57,345
2000 YTD 35,162 23,644 35,369 105,022 7,980 94,095 34,730 52,533
2000 Total 0 147,708 70,155 153,905 425,849 26,515 364,785 160,749 239,670
1999 Total 15,522 132,157 88,056 138,379 465,088 33,911 398,262 121,381 206,328
Source; Association of American Railroads
Tariff Rail Ratesfor Unit Train Shipments
March 2001
Date Tariff Rate Rate Per Rate/Per
Effective Item Commaodity Origin Destination Per Car MT Bushel*
03/02/01 45560 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $2,050 $22.60 $0.62
03/02/01 43521 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,877 $42.74 $1.16
03/02/01 46540 Whesat Kansas City, MO Houston, TX $1,550 $17.09 $0.47
03/02/01 43586 Wheat Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $4,240 $46.74 $1.27
03/02/01 43581 Whesat Omaha, NE Portland, OR $3,905 $43.04 $1.17
03/02/01 31040 Corn Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $2,900 $31.97 $0.81
03/02/01 31035 Corn Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $2,700 $29.76 $0.76
03/02/01 31040 Corn Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,700 $29.76 $0.76
03/02/01 61180 Soybean Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $2,680 $29.54 $0.80
03/02/01 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,430 $26.79 $0.73
05/01/98 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,780 $25.23 $0.83

Source: www.bnsf.com
Approximate load per car = 100 tons: Corn 56 Ibs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 |bs/bu
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Rail Deliveriesto Port
Carloads

Mississippi Texas Pacific Atlantic &

Gulf Gulf  Northwest East Gulf

Week Ending:
02/21/01 157* 1,524** 2,838 972
02/28/01 137* 1,903** 3,024 1,185
03/07/01 274* 1,993** 2,193 764
03/14/01 425* 1,113 2,842 942
03/21/01 234* 995 2,994 996
03/28/01 192* 1,774 3,538 74
YTD 2001 4,281 19,963 34,187 11,553
YTD 2000 13,469 28,246 43,024 5,655
Total 1998 23,844 115,321 138,461 12,505
Total 1997 20,152 93,265 195,953 9,147
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMSUSDA

(*) Incomplete Data
(**) Revised Data
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Barge Grain Movements
for week ending 3/24/01
Corn Wht Sybn Total
| 1,000 Tons
Mississippi River
Rock Island, IL (L15) 32 0 33 65
Winfield, MO (L25) 106 3 85 194
Alton, IL (L26) 380 5 141 542
Granite City, IL (L27) 432 9 143 600
[llinoisRiver (L8) 256 2 29 296
Ohio (L52) 145 9 28 248
Arkansas (L 1) 29 9 0 38
2001 YTD 5668 477 2810 9,605
2000YTD 6,353 334 2,388 9,598
Total 2000 33,482 2,518 10,327 48,247
Total 1999 36,711 2,883 9,771 51,887
MissYTD: Calendar year totals include Miss/27, Ohio/52 and Ark/1.
Source: U.S. Army Corp of Engineers; n/a=not available
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U.S. Export Balances (1,000 Metric Tons)
Wheat Corn Soybean Total
HRW KW HRS SWMW DUR All

Unshipped Exports-Crop Year
03/22/01 1,198 646 1,144 874 275 4,137 6,439 3,494 14,070
ThisWeek Year Ago 1,052 342 1,117 622 318 3,451 7,388 2,534 13,373
Cumulative Exports-Crop Y ear
00/01YTD 7,626 3,670 4,529 4,136 905 20,866 25,448 20,954 67,268
99/00 YTD 8,982 3,586 4,489 3,192 797 21,047 27,895 17,713 66,655
97/98 Total 9,858 4,710 6,305 5,413 1,232 27,518 37,220 24,516 89,254
96/97 Total 7,387 3,645 7,864 6,105 963 25,965 44,476 24,501 94,942
Source: Foreign Agricultural Service YTD-Y ear-to-Date (www.fas.usda.gov) Crop Y ear:Wheat=5/31-6/01, Corn & Soybeans=9/01-8/31

Select U.S. Port Regions - Grain I nspectionsfor Export - 1,000 Metric Tons

Pacific Region Mississippi Gulf Texas Gulf
Wheat Corn Soybean Wheat Corn  Soybean Wheat Corn  Soybean

03/29/01 233 122 123 114 821 370 63 8 76

2000 YTD 2,409 1,188 1,053 1,303 7,403 5,929 1,263 138 694

1999 YTD * 2,250 2,106 548 1,538 8,014 5,936 1,278 79 631

% of Last Year 22% 27% 162% 26% 24% 40% 17% 25% 50%

1998 Total 10,838 4,373 651 5048 31,330 14,917 7,270 562 1,392

Source: Federal Grain Inspection Service Y TD-Y ear-to-Date

110,000

U.S. Grain Inspected for Export

100,000

Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.
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Select Canadian Ports - Export Inspections
1,000 Metric Tons, Crop Y ear

Vancouver

Prince Rupert
Prairie Direct
Thunder Bay
St. Lawrence

% of Last Year

Source: Canadian Grains Commission
Y TD-Y ear-to-Date

Week Ended: 3/15/01

2000 YTD Exports
1999 YTD Exports

Wheat Durum Barley
3,723 299 822
1,098 0
814 192 224
490 171 36
1,722 1,340 25
7,847 2,002 1,107
8,731 2,113 932
90% 95% 119%

Crop Year 8/1-7/31
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Vessels
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25
Port Region Ocean Grain Vessals
Gulf Pacific Northwest Vancouver, B.C.
Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next
In Port 7-Days  10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days  10-Days
03/22/01 57 48 61 11 17 4 5
03/29/01 47 55 74 9 15 11 1
1999 Range (14..47) (39..65) (34..80) (6..18) (2..20) (2..15) (0..9)
1998 Range (19..62) (34..64) (40..93) (2..19) (3.14) (0..10)
1999 Avg 32 52 65 9 9 3
1998 Avg 40 48 61 10 9 3
1997 Avg 33 45 58

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/ USDA

Container Ocean Freight Rates

Monthly Weighted Averages Based on Shipping Line Monthly Mkt. Share
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA

Rate per TEU

$2,000

$1,500

$1,000

$500

$0

Container Rates - Feed Grain
Seattle, WA Origin to Selected Destinations

Oct-99

Nov-00 Jan-01
Dec-01

Nov-99
Dec-99

Jan-00 Mar-00
Feb-00

May-00 Jul-00 Sep-00
Apr-00 Jun-00  Aug-00 Oct-00

—=— Hong Kong —* Korea ~—* Keelung

$1,500

Rate per TEU

$1,000

$500

Container Rates - Soybeans
Seattle, WA Origin to Tokyo, Japan

AVW\
17

May-00 Jul-00 Sep-00

Sep-99 Nov-99 Jan-00 Mar-00
Oct-99 Dec-99 Feb-00 Apr-00 Jun-00 Aug-00 Oct-00

00 Jan-01
ec-00




APRIL 3, 2001

Grain Transportation, USDA

Page 8

Rate - Gulf to Japan
Rate - PNW to Japan

Il Spread - Gulf vs. PNW to Japan

US$/Metric Ton
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Quarterly Ocean Freight Rates

Gulf to
Japan
Mexico
Venezuela
N. Europe
N. Africa

Average Rates & Percentage Changes, U.S. Dollars/Metric Ton - Basis

2000 1999 %
4" Otr 4"0tr  Change
: Pacific NW to
$2238  $2207 1% Japan
$1339  $1521  -12% | Red Seal Arcbian Sea
$1329  $1210  10%
$1496  $1368 9% |
$2226  $2165 3% | Argentinato
: N. Europe
Japan

2000 1999 %
4"0otr  4"0Otr Change
$15.87 $13.55 17%
$26.70
$18.97 $17.77 7%

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMSUSDA; (*) rates shown are for metric ton (2,204.62 Ibs.=one metric ton)

Ocean Freight Rates (Select L ocations) - week ending 3/31/01

op=option

Source: Maritime Research Inc.; rates shown are for long ton (2,240 Ibs.=one long ton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicated;

Volume L oaded Freight Rate
Export Region Import Region Grain Month (Tons) ($Ton)
Gulf Ireland Grains Apr.1/7 25,000 $17.60
Uruguay Spain (Med.) Heavy Grain Apr.1/10 21,000 $22.00




