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Feb. 22-23 USDA’s 77th Ag. Outlook Forum 2001 Arlington, VA 202-314-3451 (ph) to register
202-720-3050 (ph) for info.

Feb. 25-27 National Corn Growers and American San Antonio, TX 636-928-3700 (ph)
Soybean Association Commodity Classic www.commodityclassic.com

Mar. 5-6 Developing Opportunities to Reduce Tampa, FL 301-977-7459 (ph)
Rail Expenses 301-977-9248 (fax)

Mar. 14-16 National Grain and Feed Assoc. (NGFA) New Orleans, LA 202-289-0873 (ph)
105th Annual Convention 202-289-5388 (fax)

abawek@ngfa.org

Mar. 14-16 National Waterways Conference/  Washington, DC 202-296-4415 (ph)
Waterways Rally 2001 202-835-3861 (fax)

Mar. 19-21 American Assoc. of Port Authorities Washington, DC 703-684-5700 (ph)
(AAPA) Spring Conference 703-684-6321 (fax) 

April 5-6 American Crop Protection Assoc. Washington, DC Cornelia Horner
Spring Conference 202-296-1585 (ph)

202-524-0474 (fax)
cornelia@acpa.org

April 18-20 Global Agriculture 2020: Which Way Norwich, U. K. Caroline Websdale
Forward? +44 1603 450641 (ph)

+44 1603 40045/450015 (fax)

April 18-20 Inland Rivers, Ports, & Terminals Baton Rouge, LA Diedre McGowan
Annual Meeting 601-352-4778 (ph)

601-355-1506 (fax)

May 7-9 American Feed Industry Association Indianapolis, IN 703-524-0810 (ph)
Feed Industry Show and Educational Forum 703-524-1921 (fax)

afia@afia.org

May 20-24 International Wheat Quality Conference II Manhattan, KS Marsha Grunewald
785-776-2757 (ph)
marsh@usgmrl.ksu.edu

May 22-24 National Agricultural Biotechnology Chicago, IL 217-244-1706 (ph) 
Council Conference.  High Anxiety and 217-244-1707 (fax)
Biotechnology: Who’s Buying, Who’s Not nsrl@uiuc.edu
and Why?

June 17-21 Joint Meeting: 118th Annual Seed Trade San Antonio, TX 202-638-3128 (ph)
Assoc. Convention/30th Annual Mexican 202-638-3171 (fax)
Seed Trade Assoc. Convention

June 18-29 Advances in Agricultural Production and Various Locations, USA 256-381-6600 (ph)
Fertilization: U.S. Study Tour 256-381-7408 (fax)

hrdu@IFDC.org
Report is prepared by Karl Hacker and Sigal Nissan, Agricultural Economists, Transportation & Marketing, Agricultural Marketing Service, USDA  (202) 690-1304.   Report design by Kimberly Vachal, Upper Great Plains
Transportation Institute, North Dakota State University.    This report can be found on the Internet at www.ams.usda.gov/tmd/grain.htm.  E-mail comments to Karl.Hacker@usda.gov .
The United States Department of Agriculture (USDA) prohibits discrimination in all its programs and activities on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, political beliefs, sexual orientation or
marital or family status.  (Not all prohibited bases apply to all programs).  Persons with disabilities who require alternative means for communication of program information  (Braille, large print, audiotape, etc.) should contact
the USDA’s TARGET Center at (202)720-2600.  To file a complaint, write USDA, Director of Civil Rights, Room 326-W, Whitten Building, 14th and Independence Avenue, SW, Washington, DC, 20250-9410, or call (202)
720-5964 (voice and TDD).  USDA is an equal opportunity provider and employer.
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Grain Bid Summary

(r)=rail, (t)=truck, (b)=barge;  NQ=No Quote

Inland Bids:  12%  HRW, 14% HRS, #1 SRW, #1 DUR, #1 SWW, #2 Y Corn, #1 Y Soybeans
Export Bids:  Ord. HRW, 14% HRS, #2 SRW, #2 DUR, #2 SWW, #2 Y Corn, #1 Y Soybeans

Sources...U.S. Inland:  All (except ND) - Market News Report, AMS, USDA (www.usda.ams.gov)
            ND - Friday Local Cash Grain Prices, AgWeek, Grand Forks, ND

    U.S. Export: Corn & Soybean  - Export Grain Bids, AMS, USDA 
                        Wheat Bids - Weekly Wheat Report, U.S. Wheat Associates, Washington, D.C.
    Canada:      Bids in CAN$, Canadian Wheat Board, Winnipeg (www.cwb.ca)

Gre a t  La k e s -To le d o

Po r t la n d
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HRS 3.06
DUR 3.87
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(t)

HRS NQ
DUR NQ
(t)
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Sybn 4.25H R W 3.08

C orn 1.83

#1C WR S 5.75
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30-day to Arrive

Terminal Market (t)

Elevator Bid

Pool Return Outlook

Futures: Week Ago Year Ago
01/26/01 01/19/01 01/28/00

Kansas City Wht Mar 3.2500 3.3250 2.8775
Minneapolis Wht Mar 3.2825 3.2950 3.2225
Minneapolis Dur Mar 5.1300 5.1300 n.a.
Chicago Wht Mar 2.7625 2.8550 2.5975
Chicago Corn Mar 2.0950 2.1500 2.2350
Chicago Sybn Mar 4.6025 4.7075 5.2350

H R W 3.73
D U R 5.26
H R S 4.19
SR W 3
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(b)
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Secondary Rail Market Bids
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2.29

Lewiston

4.81
Barge Benchmark Tariff Rates

Est. 1976 - 'Tariff No. 7'

    
4.04

Owensboro

Rail Car ‘Auction’ Offerings 

Delivery for: Feb-01 Apr-01
Offered % Sold Offered % Sold

BNSF-COT 9,712 79% 10,857 3%

UP-GCAS 5,400 0% 5,400 0%
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA; www.bnsf.com; www.uprr.com

Secondary Rail Car Market 
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Week

Delivery Period
Feb-01 Mar-01 Apr-01 May-01

BNSF-GF $95 $24 $6 $(6)

UP-Pool $(24) $(29) $(48) $(48)

Source: T&M/AMS/USDA.  Data from Atwood/ConAgra., Harvest States Co-op,
James B. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.;

GF=Guaranteed Freight, GEEP=Guaranteed Eqpt. Exchange, Pool=Guaranteed Pool

note... bids listed are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guaranteed prices,
missing value=No Bid Quoted

Railroad Car ‘Auction’ Results 
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Auction

Delivery for: Mar-01 Apr-01 May-01

COT/N. Grain $9 no bid no bid

COT/S. Grain $2 no bid no bid

GCAS/Region 2 no bid no bid no offer

GCAS/Region 4 no bid no bid no offer
Source: T&M/AMS USDA.  Data from www.bnsf.com,  www.uprr.com, 
(COT=Certificate of Transportation; GCAS=Grain Car Allocation System)

Southbound Barge Freight Nominal/Cash Basis Values
Index=Percent of Tariff, Based on 1976 Tariff Benchmark Rate

Week
ended River/Region

Contract
Period

  Rate

Futures Cash

02/6/01 St. Louis

Illinois River

Mar
May
Jul
Sep
Nov
Mar
May
Jul
Sep
Nov

 133 
 125 
 135 
 183 
 158 
 164 
 148 
 150 
 208 
 178 

 140 
 138 
 138 

 0 
 0 

 170 
 150 
 160 

 0 
 0 
  

Source:  St. Louis Merchants Exchange

Southbound Barge Freight Spot Rates

1/31/00 1/24/00 Feb. ‘00 Apr. ‘00
Twin Cities 0 0 0 202
Mid-Mississippi 0 0 0 165
Illinois River 204 240 179 155
St. Louis 155 208 146 132
Lower Ohio 149 180 150 141
Cairo-Memphis 141 171 141 129
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA 
nq=no quote;   
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Carloads

Grain Car Loadings for Class I Railroads

Class I Railroad Grain Car Loadings

Week Ending: Carloads
1/13/01 23,270

1/20/01 25,076
1/27/01 24,361

Year to Date - 2001 91,373
Year to Date - 2000 99,688

Total 2000 1,188,917
Total 1999 1,270,375

Source:  Association of American Railroads

Class I Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin
Grain Carloads Originated

East West Canada
Conrail CSXT IC NS BNSF KCS UP CN CP

01/27/01 0 3,572 0 3,029 10,074 688 6,998 4,740 5,820

This Week Last Year 0 2,719 1,992 2,662 7,855 838 6,646 2,594 3,811

2001 YTD 0 13,505 0 13,032 35,840 1,988 27,008 18,593 20,007

2000 YTD 0 11,784 7,380 11,852 34,897 2,808 30,967 10,898 14,047

2000 Total 0 147,708 70,155 153,905 425,849 26,515 364,785 160,749 239,670

1999 Total 15,522 132,157 88,056 138,379 465,088 33,911 398,262 121,381 206,328
       Source: Association of American Railroads

Tariff Rail Rates for Unit Train Shipments
February 2001
Date 
Effective

Tariff 
Item Commodity Origin Destination

Rate
Per Car

Rate Per
MT

Rate/Per
Bushel*

02/05/01 45560 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $2,050 $22.60 $0.62
02/05/01 43521 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,877 $42.74 $1.16
02/05/01 46540 Wheat Kansas City, MO Houston, TX $1,550 $17.09 $0.47
02/05/01 43586 Wheat Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $4,240 $46.74 $1.27
02/05/01 43581 Wheat Omaha, NE Portland, OR $3,905 $43.04 $1.17
02/05/01 31040 Corn Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $2,900 $31.97 $0.81
02/05/01 31035 Corn Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $2,700 $29.76 $0.76
02/05/01 31040 Corn Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,700 $29.76 $0.76
02/05/01 61180 Soybean Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $2,680 $29.54 $0.80
02/05/01 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,430 $26.79 $0.73
05/01/98 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,780 $25.23 $0.83
Source: www.bnsf.com
Approximate load per car = 100 tons: Corn 56 lbs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 lbs/bu
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Pacific Northwest
Texas Gulf
Mississippi Gulf

Rail Deliveries to Port
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Soybeans
Wheat
Corn

Barge Movements - Locks 27

Rail Deliveries to Port
Carloads

Mississippi
Gulf

Texas 
Gulf

Pacific
Northwest

Atlantic &
East Gulf

Week Ending:
12/27/00   14* 1,339 1,350 131

01/03/01   108* 826 1,618 610

01/10/01   298* 1,499 2,057 455

01/17/01   658* 888 3,009 973

01/24/01   445* 1,556 2,694 831

01/31/01   524* 1,568 3,000 892

YTD 2001   2,033* 6,337 12,378 3,761

YTD 2000 4,751 9,203 16,610 1,428

Total 1998 23,844 115,321 138,461 12,505

Total 1997 20,152 93,265 195,953 9,147
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA

.
 (*)   Incomplete Data

  

Barge Grain Movements
for week ending 1/27/00

Corn Wht Sybn Total
1,000 Tons

Mississippi River 
Rock Island, IL (L15) 0 0 0 0

Winfield, MO (L25) 0 0 0 0

Alton, IL (L26) 258 13 129 400

Granite City, IL (L27) 268 13 130 410

Illinois River  (L8) 169 13 118 299

Ohio (L52) 219 3 78 343

Arkansas (L1) 0 38 16 53
2001 YTD  1,539 176 565 2,466
2000 YTD 2,088 100 704 3,083
Total 2000 33,482 2,518 10,327 48,247

Total 1999 36,711 2,883 9,771 51,887

Miss YTD:  Calendar year totals include Miss/27, Ohio/52 and Ark/1.
Source:  U.S. Army Corp of Engineers; n/a=not available  
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Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.

U.S. Grain Inspected for Export

U.S. Export Balances (1,000 Metric Tons)
Wheat Corn Soybean Total

HRW SRW HRS SWW DUR All 
Unshipped Exports-Crop Year

01/25/01 1,118 530 998 981 140 3,767 7,071 6,476 17,314

This Week Year Ago 870 428 837 442 237 2,813 7,615 3,613 14,041

Cumulative Exports-Crop Year
00/01 YTD 6,332 3,030 3,642 3,324 807 17,133 18,382 13,996 49,511

99/00 YTD 7,882 2,888 3,697 2,767 673 17,907 20,673 17,713 56,293

97/98 Total 9,858 4,710 6,305 5,413 1,232 27,518 37,220 24,516 89,254

96/97 Total 7,387 3,645 7,864 6,105 963 25,965 44,476 24,501 94,942
       Source: Foreign Agricultural Service YTD-Year-to-Date (www.fas.usda.gov) Crop Year:Wheat=5/31-6/01, Corn & Soybeans=9/01-8/31

Select U.S. Port Regions - Grain Inspections for Export - 1,000 Metric Tons
Pacific Region Mississippi Gulf Texas Gulf

Wheat Corn Soybean Wheat Corn Soybean Wheat Corn Soybean
01/18/01 149 211 60 29 639 464 6 18 58

2000 YTD 320 253 76 114 1,243 704 127 18 58

1999 YTD * 446 310 93 284 1,572 1,072 219 3 51

% of Last Year 3% 6% 12% 2% 4% 5% 2% 3% 4%

1998 Total 10,838 4,373 651 5,048 31,330 14,917 7,270 562 1,392
Source: Federal Grain Inspection Service     YTD-Year-to-Date 

Select Canadian Ports - Export Inspections 
1,000 Metric Tons, Crop Year

Wheat Durum Barley
Week Ended: 2/02/01

Vancouver 3,172 255 629
Prince Rupert 665 0
Prairie Direct 668 175 183
Thunder Bay 490 171 36
St. Lawrence 1,462 1,126 25

2000 YTD Exports 6,457 1,727 873

1999 YTD Exports 6,827 1,805 701

% of Last Year 95% 96% 125%
Source: Canadian Grains Commission     
YTD-Year-to-Date                Crop Year 8/1-7/31 
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 Gulf Region 
Vessels Loaded
 - Past 7 Days-
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Container Rates - Soybeans 
Seattle, WA Origin to Tokyo, Japan
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Hong Kong Korea Keelung

Container Rates - Feed Grain
Seattle, WA Origin to Selected Destinations

Port Region Ocean Grain Vessels
Gulf Pacific Northwest Vancouver, B.C.

Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next
In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days

01/25/01 36 48 81 13 15 9 2

02/01/01 54 52 76 17 12 8 2

1999 Range (14..47) (39..65) (34..80) (6..18) (2..20) (2..15) (0..9)

1998 Range (19..62) (34..64) (40..93) (1..19) (3..14) (0..10)

1999 Avg 32 52 65 9 9 3

1998 Avg 40 48 61 10 9 3

1997 Avg 33 45 58
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/ USDA 

Container Ocean Freight Rates 
Monthly Weighted Averages Based on Shipping Line Monthly Mkt. Share
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA
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Quarterly Ocean 
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Quarterly Ocean Freight Rates
Average Rates & Percentage Changes, U.S. Dollars/Metric Ton - Basis 

2000
4th Qtr

1999
4th Qtr

%
Change

2000
4th Qtr

1999
4th Qtr

    %    
Change 

Gulf to Pacific NW to
Japan $22.38 $22.07 1% Japan $15.87 $13.55 17%

Mexico $13.39 $15.21 -12% Red Sea/ Arabian Sea $26.70

Venezuela $13.29 $12.10 10%

N. Europe $14.96 $13.68 9%

N. Africa $22.26 $21.65 3% Argentina to
N. Europe $18.97 $17.77 7%

Japan
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA; (*) rates shown are for metric ton (2,204.62 lbs.=one metric ton) 

Ocean Freight Rates  (Select Locations) - week ending 2/3/01

Export Region Import Region Grain Month
Volume Loaded 

(Tons)
Freight Rate

($Ton)

Gulf Peru Wheat Jan.22/29 10,000 $32.00
Gulf Peru (2 pts ) Wheat Jan.22/29 30,000 $51.07 op 53.07
Gulf So. Korea Heavy Grain Feb.6/13 52,000 $21.75
Gulf China Soybeans Feb.8/15 55,000 $21.00
Gulf China Heavy Grain Feb.10/20 55,000 $21.00
Gulf China Heavy Grain Feb.16/21 55,000 $21.25
Portbury (U.K.) Israel Wheat Spot 18,000/18,250 $14.00
Southampton (U.K.) Tunis Barley Jan.28/31 15,000 $16.00
France (Atlantic) Morocco Wheat Jan.31/Feb.5 30,000 $9.95
Rozi  (India) So. Korea Wheat Feb.2/8 32,000 $13.00
Source: Maritime Research Inc.;  rates shown are for long ton (2,240 lbs.=one long ton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicated; op=option


