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March 9-13 United Soybean Board Meeting St. Louis, MO Kay Haines
1-800-989-USB1

March 21-23 Food Safety Summit & Expo Washington, DC 202-639-5995 (ph)
arickard@nfpa-food.org
March 26-30 Biotechnology Meeting & Exhibition Boston, MA 202-857-0244
March 29-31 National Grain & Feed 10Annual Conf. San Diego, CA 202-289-0873 (ph)
202-289-5388 (fax)
March 30-31 Farming For The Future: National Conf. Denver, CO Vicki Rodriguez
Of State Legislators & The Assembly On 303-830-2200
State Issues
April 5 Ag Shipper Transportation Workshop Atlanta, GA 202-467-8380 (ph)
April 9-11 Canada Grains Council Annual Conf. Winnipeg, Manitoba 204-942-2254 (ph)

analysis@canadagrainscouncil.ca

April 11-13 17" International Intermodal Expo 2000 Atlanta, GA 800-243-4021 (ph)
404-584-7458 (ph-int'l)
404-584-0685 (fax)

April 13-15 Taking Ag. Into The Next Millenium Ottawa, Canada V. Davidson
613-989-3976

May 1-3 Agricultural Machinery Conference Cedar Rapids, IA 515-532-6025 (ph)
515-532-3553 (fax)
saluch@saver.com

May 30-31 Rail Transportation Conference: Ralil Philadelphia, PA Alyssa Schneiderman
Logistics 212-837-7163 (ph)
aschneiderman@mail.joc.com
May 31-June 2 Ports America 2000 Conference & Philadelphia, PA Alyssa Schneiderman
Exhibition: Port Operation & 212-837-7163 (ph)
International Logistics aschneiderman@mail.joc.com
June 5-7 Corn Utilization & Technology Conf. St. Paul, MN Jennifer Snyder

202-331-1634 (ph)
jsnyder@corn.org

June 18-22 117 American Seed Trade Association San Francisco, CA 202-638-3128 (ph)
(ASTA) Convention 202-638-3171 (fax)
June 19-20 2000 Legislative & Leadership Conf. of Washington, DC Fletcher Hall
the Ag. Transporters Conference (ATC) 703-838-7999 (ph)

.Report is prepared by Karl Hacker and Chambre’ Malone, Transportation & Marketing, Agricultural Marketing Service, USOB®0AGPY. Report design by Kimberly Vachal, Upper Great Plains Transportation
Institute, North Dakota State University. You can retrieve this document from our Automatic Fax System by using the hgoutsietxamachine and dialing (202) 690-1707. This report can be found on the Internet at
www.ams.usda.gov/tmd/grain.htm. E-mail comments to GTR@usda.gov.

The United States Department of Agriculture (USDA) prohibits discrimination in all its programs and activities on theréesj<olor, national origin, gender, religion, age, disability, political beliefs, sexual orientation
and marital or family status. (Not all prohibited bases apply to all programs). Persons with disabilities who requiieeattearss for communication of program information (Braille, large print, audiotape, etc.) should
contact the USDA’s TARGET Center at (202)720-2600. To file a complaint, write USDA, Director of Civil Rights, Room 326-ish Bfiiding, 14 and Independence Avenue, SW, Washington, DC, 20250-9419, or
call (202) 720-5964 (voice or TDD). USDA is an equal opportunity provider and employer.
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. . Futures: Week Ago  Year Ago
Grain Bid Summary i
Kansas City ~ Wht Mar 2.8675 2.7700 2.9600
Minneapolis ~ Wht Mar 3.2100 3.1075 3.4200
Minneapolis ~ Dur Mar NQ NQ na.
Chicago Wht Mar 25825 2.4800 26775
& #ICWRS 531 Chicago Corn Mar 2.2550 21325 2.1600
Po rtla n d #ICWAD 559 Chicago Sybn Jan 5.1300 4.9700 4.6450
i HRW 315 .
HRS 390 HRW 241 ° Great Lakes-Duluth
SWwW 2.87 HRS 286 . HRS NQ
Corn NQ HRS 288 i DUR NQ
Sybn  NQ wr DUR 328 ND ®
(r,tb)
HRS  NQ
DUR 415
MN
) Great Lakes-Toledo
Comn 190 s~ Corn 205
HRW 244 ° Sybn 470 Sybn 491
Corn 1.90 A
NE o
SRW 220
HRW 261 Corn  2.03
Sybn 4.88
KS L
MO
HRW 217
®  Elevator Bid
[
Terminal Market (1) OK
i 30-day to Arrive
¢  Pool Return Outlook
&i«
(n)=rail, (t)=truck, (b)=barge; NQ=No Quote - Gulf-Louisiana
Inland Bids: 12% HRW, 14% HRS, #1 SRW, #1 DUR, #1 SWW, #2 Y Corn, #1 Y Soybeans ... Gulf Comn 242
Export Bids: Ord. HRW, 14% HRS, #2 SRW, #2 DUR, #2 SWW, #2 Y Corn, #1 Y Soybeans HRW 3.38 Sybn 534
Sources...U.S. Inland: All (except ND) - Market News Report, AMS, USDA (www.usda.ams.gov) DUR 4.40 (b)
ND - Friday Local Cash Grain Prices, AgWeek, Grand Forks, ND HRS 3.99
U.S. Export: Corn & Soybean - Export Grain Bids, AMS, USDA )
Wheat Bids - Weekly Wheat Report, U.S. Wheat Associates, Washington, D.C. SRW 267

Canada:  Bids in CANS$, Canadian Wheat Board, Winnipeg (www.cwb.ca)

Spot Barge Rate - Illinois River

Index - Percent of Tariff Rate
350%

== \Weekly Movements Based on 4-Week Running Avg.
— 3-Yr Avg. Rate for Week
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Rail Car ‘Auction’ Offerings
Delivery for: Mar-00 May-00
Offered % Sold Offered % Sold
BNSF-COT 12,000 3% 12,000 1%
UP-GCAS 5,400 1% 5,400 0%
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDwww.bnsf.com; www.uprr.com

Secondary Rail Car Market
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Gatast Week

Delivery Period

Railroad Car ‘Auction’ Results
Average Premium/Discount to Tariff, $/Car - Last Auction

Mar-00 Apr-00 May-00 Jun-00
BNSF-GF $(7) $(49) $(31) $(12) Delivery for: Mar-00 Apr-00 May-00
COTI/N. Grain no bid no bid no bid

UP-Pool $(4) $(16) $(20) $(14)
COT/S. Grain no bid no bid no bid
GCAS/Region 2 no bid no bid no bid

Source: T&M/AMS/USDA. Data from Atwood/ConAgra., Harvest States Co-op,

James B. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.; GCAS/Region 4 no bid no bid no bid

GF=Guaranteed Freight, GEEP=Guaranteed Eqpt. Exchange, Pool=Guaranted

note... bids listed are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guarante

H Pool Source: T&M/AMS USDA. Data fromvww.bnsf.com, www.uprr.com,

COT=Certificate of Transportation;: GCAS=Grain Car Allocation System

bd

prices, missing value=No Bid Quoted

Southbound Barge Freight Nominal Values
Index=Percent of Tariff, Based on 1976 Tariff Benchmark Rate

Week
ended*

River/Region Contract

Period

Rate

Summary Of Daily Barge Trades Reported To St. Louis Merchants Exchange.

(*) current data unavailable

Barge Benchmark Tariff Rates
Est. 1976 - ‘Tariff No. 7'

Southbound Barge Freight Spot Rates

3/1/00 2/23/00 Apr. ‘00 June ‘00]
Twin Cities ng nq 205 200
Mid-Mississippi 188 nq 171 171
lllinois River 168 171 160 160
St. Louis 153 150 141 139
Lower Ohio 166 151 144 139
Cairo-Memphis 139 144 133 133
Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/USDA
ng=no quote

Lewiston

Minneapolis
6.1

Davenport
5.32

Cincinnati

St. Louis
3.99

Greenville
2.29
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Grain Car Loadings for Class | Railroads
Carloads
35,000
H H H e== \Neekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.
Class | Railroad Grain Car Loadings 31 Avg of Carloads for Week
Week Ending: Carloads
2/12/00 25,916 30,000
02/19/00 25,440
02/26/00 24,743
Year to Date - 2000 201,077
Year to Date - 1999 198,32 25000
Total 1999 1,269,741]
20,000
**1998 - 52 weeks
* 1997 - 53 weeks
15,000
8 & & 8 8 & 5 & 3 8 3 3 3
2 & 8 g8 2 g &8 8§ g8 § 8 8 &
g ¢ 4 & 88 8 g 4 & g 8 B 3
Class | Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin
Carloads
East West Canada
Conrail  CSXT IC NS BNSF KCS UP CN CP
02/19/00 0 2,684 2,084 3,230 9,078 628 7,736 2,994 4,641
This Week Last Year 920 2,274 1,737 3,106 7,855 773 7,610 2,172 2,455
2000 YTD 0 20,212 13,721 20,733 61,712 4,744 55,212 19,967 27,747
1999 YTD 5,208 18,158 10,439 19,188 60,586 5,236 56,296 13,224 20,444
1999 Total 15,522 132,157 88,056 138,379 465,088 33,911 398,262 121,381 206,328
1998 Total 40,192 126,128 77,811 131,158 431,459 34,503 342,609 113,568 215,005
Source: Association of American Railroads
**1998 - 52 weeks
* 1997 - 53 weeks
Tariff Rail Rates for Unit Train Shipments
March 2000
Date Tariff Rate Rate Per Rate/Per
Effective Iltem Commodity Origin Destination Per Car MT Bushel*
03/06/00 45560 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $2,050 $22.60 $0.62
03/06/00 43521 Wheat Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,877 $42.74 $1.16
03/06/00 46540 Wheat Kansas City, MO Houston, TX $1,550 $17.09 $0.47
03/06/00 43586 Wheat Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $4,133 $45.56 $1.24
03/06/00 43581 Wheat Omaha, NE Portland, OR $3,805 $41.94 $1.14
03/06/00 31040 Corn Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,000 $33.07 $0.84
03/06/00 31035 Corn Kansas City, MO Portland, OR $2,600 $28.66 $0.73
03/06/00 31040 Corn Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,615 $28.82 $0.73
03/06/00 61180 Soybean Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $2,880 $31.75 $0.86
03/06/00 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,480 $27.34 $0.74
05/01/98 61180 Soybean Omaha, NE Portland, OR $2,780 $25.23 $0.83

Source: www.bnsf.com

Approximate load per car = 100 tons: Corn 56 Ibs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 Ibs/bu
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Rail Deliveries to Port Rail Deliveries to Port
Carloads
L e R Carloads
Mississippi  Texas Pacific Atlantic & 9,000 S :
Guif  Gulf  Northwest East Guit Mississppi Gul e o an|
- 8,000 | -
Week Ending: Texas Gulf
01/19/00 954 1,999 4,160 870 7.000 = pacific Northwest
01/26/00 1,101 1,805 3,903* 373 6,000 -
02/02/00 1,302 1,668 3,282** 105
5,000
02/09/00 1,810 2,370 3,896 830
4,000
02/16/00 1,187 2,580 2,816 621
3,000
02/23/00 1,167 2,286* 3,128 525
2,000
YTD 2000 8,915 16,439 26,450 3,404 1,000
YTD 1999 5,910 22,621 20,414 3,320 N \/, 7 N =
oL C ol ~_ .
2 2 2 e 2 2 4
Total 1998 23,844 115,321 138,461 12,50p § § &8 § B § § 3 8§ E 5 § g 5 § s
| 5 848 ¢ 88 d 3 333 g 3F g g
Total 1997 20,152 93,265 195,953 9,14
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA
* Incomplete Data
** Revised Data (from 2-22-00 report)
1,000 Tons for week ending 2/26/00
1,400
o Sirmigh nes Indiate Weeldy v, for Past § voars Com  wht Syon  Tota
_ , ons
1,200 \fwleat Mississippi River
Lonp | YPeans Rock Island, IL (L15) O 0 0 0
- ﬂ Winfield, MO (L25) 14 0 0 14
800 - Alton, IL (L26) 437 3 118 558
o001 /| A N A Granite City, IL(L27) 445 3 102 551
V V ‘\Il V lllinois River (L8) 159 0 16 175
400 - |
L 3 1‘\ R i Ohio (L52) 54 2 31 111
| I \ Iy v [
200 | | v R o I
C TR T /L\i\fﬁ\ii\***\v,:v\m /*lﬁ!kﬁwijff\ﬁ Arkansas (L1) 0 32 25 57
. Vo, o e T T A Y o 2000 YTD 3,976 242 1,448 6,02
y— — = -]
E 88t 822 niuomisssaaaaas 1999 YTD 4,285 403 1,047 6,46
~ @ M~ © [ [} - ] 1 ’
3583585858888 35¢¢% j
h - - h h Total 1999 31,001 2,401 8,674 45,17
Total 1998 31,226 2,420 8,866 45,64
Miss YTD: Calendar year totals include Miss/27, Ohio/52 and Al
Source: U.S. Army Corp of Engineers

k/1.
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U.S. Export Balancegq1,000 Metric Tons)

Unshipped Exports-Crop Year
02/24/00

This Week Year Ago

Cumulative Exports-Crop Year
99/00 YTD

98/99 YTD
97/98 Total

96/97 Total

HRW SRW

963 405
1,440 630

8,540 3,286
8,041 1,471

9,858 4,710

7,387 3,645

HRS

996
825

4,134
4,979

6,305

7,864

Wheat

SWW

482
761

3,035
4,360

5,413

6,105

DUR

210
214

713
676

1,232

963

All

3,057

Corn Soybean Total

3,870

19,708

19,52

6

27,518

25,965

7,590 3,958 14,605
8,620 3,103 15,593

24,282 16,479 60,469
22,175 17,713 59,414

37,220 24,516 89,254

44,476 24,501 94,942

Source: Foreign Agricultural Service YTD-Year-to-Dateviv.fas.usdayov) Crop Year:Wheat=5/31-6/01, Corn & Soybeans=9/01-8/31

Select U.S. Port Regions - Gain Inspections for Export1,000 Metric Tons

Pacific Region

Wheat Corn Soybean
03/02/00 191 14
2000 YTD 1,609 1,544 268
1999 YTD * 1,640 968 61
% of Last Year 35% 41%
1998 Total 10,838 4,373 651

Mississippi Gulf
Wheat Corn  Soybean
116 453 506
1,072 5,487 4,087
701 4,971 3,096
21% 18% 27%
5,048 31,330 14,917

Texas Gulf

Wheat Corn  Soypean

142

858
1,308

12%

7,270

7 52

38 384
52 460
7% 28%
562 1,392

Source: Federal Grain Inspection Service

* YTD-Year-to-Date (‘98 = 53 week period)

Select Canadian Ports - Export Inspections
1,000 Metric Tons, Crop Year

Vancouver
Prince Rupert
Prairie Direct
Thunder Bay
St. Lawrence

1999 YTD Exports
1998 YTD Exports

% of Last Year

Week Ended: 3/02/00

Wheat Durum Barley
3,116 562 333
2,180 3 68
544 171 249
468 193 165
1,870 1,069 0
8,178 1,998 816
5,990 1,982 522
137% 101% 156%

YTD-Year-to-Date

Source: Canadian Grains Commission

Crop Year 8/1-7/31
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Weekly Movement based on 4-Week Running Avg.

Gulf Region
Vessels Loaded
- Past 7 Days-

25

01/03/96
05/01/96
08/28/96
12/25/96

04/24/97

08/21/97
12/18/97
04/16/98
08/13/98
12/10/98

04/08/99
08/05/99

Port Region Ocean Grain Vessels

Gulf Pacific Northwest Vancouver, B.C.
Loaded Due Next Loaded Due Next Loaded Due N
In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days In Port 7-Days 10-Days
02/24/00 37 51 66 10 12 8 2
03/02/00 50 44 65 10 9 12 5
1999 Range (14..47) (39..65) (34..80) (6..18) (2..20) (2..15) (0
1998 Range (19..62) (34..64) (40..93) (1..19) (3..14) (..
1999 Avg 32 52 65 9 9 3
1998 Avg 40 48 61 10 9 3
1997 Avg 33 45 58

ext

9)

10)

Source: Transportation & Marketing /AMS/ USDA

Container Ocean Freight Rates
Monthly Weighted Averages Based on Shipping Line Monthly Mkt. Share

Rate per TEU

$1,000

$900

$800

$700

$600

$500

$400

$300

Container Rates - Feed Grain
Seattle, WA Origin to Selected Destinations

Sep-99

Oct-99 Nov-99 Dec-99 Jan-00

—=— Hong Kong —* Korea - & Keelung

Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA

Feb-00

Container Rates - Soybeans
Seattle, WA Origin to Tokyo, Japan

$1,300

$1,200

$1,100 L]

$1,000

$900

$800

Rate per TEU

$700

$600

\

$500

\

$400
Sep-99

Oct-99 Nov-99 Dec-99 Jan-00

Feb-00
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US$/Metric Ton
$40

Rate - Gulf to Japan
—— Rate - PNW to Japan

I Spread - Gulf vs. PNW to Japan f‘\

..\_‘ PN \/
NN i ‘ Quarterly Ocean

Freight Rates

$30

$20

$10

$0

e
)
(<]

Quarterly Ocean Freight Rates
Average Rates & Percentage Changes, U.S. Dollars/Metric Ton - Basis
1999 1998 % 1999 1998 %
4" Qtr 4"Qtr  Change 4"0tr  4"Qtr Change
Gulf to Pacific NW to
Japan $22.07 $13.33 66% Japan $13.55 $10.17 33%
Mexico $15.21 $14.41 6% Red Sea/ Arabian Sea
Venezuela $12.10 $10.87 11%
N. Europe $13.68 $8.81  55% |
N.Afica  $2165  $1526  42% | Argentinato
: N. Europe $17.77 $12.56 42%
Japan
Source: Transportation & Marketing/AMS/USDA, (*) rates shown are for metric ton (2,250 Ibs.=one metric ton)

Ocean Freight Rates(Select Locations) - week ending 3/4/00

Volume Loaded Freight Rate
Export Region Import Region Grain Month (Tons) ($Ton)
Gulf Venezuela Grains Prompt 33,000 $11.00
Tampa Amsterdam Grains Prompt 25,000 $16.50
Gulf Italy (2 Pts.) Wheat Spot 32,000 $21.00
Gulf Israel Heavy Grain Prompt 55,000 $13.75
Gulf Ethiopia via Djibouti Wheat Mar./Apr./May 30,000 $63.90-93.1
Gulf No. China Soybeans March 50,000 $21.75
Gulf China Heavy Grain March 50,000 $21.00
Brazil Europe Grains March 40,000 $15.50
River Plate Jordan Heavy Grain March 35,000/38,500 $23.00
France Saudi Arabia Barley March 55,000 $17.25
Source: Maritime Research Inc.; rates shown are for long ton (2,240 Ibs.=one long ton),&éx¢& . where otherwise indicated




