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WEEKLY HIGHLIGHTS @

Barge Grain ShipmentsTop 1 Million TonsAgain

For the second consecutive week, barge grain traffic topped 1 million tons. During the week

ending November 17, bargegrain shipmentson the Miss ssippi River system totaled 1.076 milliontons, an
increase of 0.4 percent from the previous week’s 1.072 milli on tons, and 18 percent from the same week last
Article/ year.
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Grain Inspections Down Overall, but Higher in the Mississippi Gul f
. During theweek of November 15, total ingpections of com, wheat, and soybeans for export from all major
Grain , U.S. portstotaled 2.33 million metric tons (mmt), down 2 percent from a week ago, but 9 percent higher than
Transportation last year and just 1 percent below the 3-year average. Grain inspectionsin the Mississippi Gulf, however,
Indicators increased 14 percent to 1.39 mmt.

Rail Grain DeliveriestoU.S. Ports Remain Strong

. Rail grain deliveriesto U.S. portsremain unusually large due to strong world demand for U.S. grain. For the
Rail 4 weeks ending November 14, rail deliveries were down 4 percent from the prior 4-week average, but 27
percent higher than last year and 29 percent higher thanthe 3-year average. As of November 8—only 10
weeks into the marketi ng year—export commitments for corn (30.7 mmt) and soybean (14.4 mmt) are at 51
Barge percent and 54 percent, respectively, of the projected marketing year total. Wheat export commitments (27
mmt) are at 86 percent of the projected total.

October Grain Inspections Reach Record

Truck According to the Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Admini stration, export grain inspections from all
U.S. port regions, including movements across U.S. land borders, reached a record 520 million bushelsin
October, 19 percent higher than the prior month and 20 percent above October 2006. The increase was fueled
Exports mainly by record Pacific Northwest (PNW) grain inspections (126 million bushels), which were 85 percent
higher than the previous month and 26 percent higher than last October. PNW grain inspecti onswere
destined mainly for Asa, with record volumes of wheat (140 million bushels) and corn (205 million bushels).

Ocean Agricultural Refrigerated Truck Quarterly Report (AgRTQ) Published The3™ quarter 2007 AgRTQ is
now available on-line. Thisreport providesaview of U.S. regional refrigerated trudkload movements. The
AgRTQ tracksvolume and ratesfor major U.S. fresh fruit and vegetable industry producing regions and
Brazil consuming markets. This quarter’s issue includes a featurearticleon U.S.-Mexico Fresh Produce Trade. The
report can be viewed at: http://www .ams.usda.gov/tmd2/rtq/

Snapshot by Sector

Mexico
Rail
Quarterly During theweek ending November 10, U.S. railroads originated 26,924 carloads of grain, down 6 percent
Updates from last week, but 14 percent higher than last year and 17 percent higher than the 3-year average.
- Ocean
Specialists During theweek ending November 15, 59 grain vessels wer e loaded inthe Gul f, up 34 percent from last
o year. Sixty-eight vessel swere due within the next ten days, unchanged from last year.
Subscription
Information Inthe week ending November 14, the cost of shipping grain from the Gulf to Japan was $118 per mt, up 3
percent from last week. The cost from the PNW was $90 per mt, down 2 percent.
Export Sales
The next During theweek ending November 8, export sal es of com, soybeans, and wheat totaled 3.1 mmt, 44 percent
releaseis higher than last week.
November 29,07
Fuel

During theweek ending November 19, the average U.S. diesel fuel price was $3.41 per gallon—0.4 percent
less than the previous week and 34 percent higher than last year.



http://www.ams.usda.gov/tmdtsb/grain/Mexico/Mexico2007.htm
http://www.ams.usda.gov/tmdtsb/grain/QuarterlyUpdates/QuarterlyUpdates2006.htm
mailto:GTRContactUs@usda.gov
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Feature Article/Calendar

Funding Process Beginsfor the Upper Mississ ppi River Syssem NESP

Now that the Water Resource Development Act (WRDA) of 2007 has been authorized, the U.S. Army Corps of
Engineers (Corps) will seek funding for new locks on the Upper Mississippi River and Illi nois Waterway. The
Upper Mississippi River Sysem Navigation and

L RIVE Missisdppi River and Illinois Water way Lock Plan
Ecosystem Sugtainability Program (NESP)

proposes the congtruction of seven new locksat a
cost $1.95 hillion (in October 2006 dollars). The PED* start] Congruction start| Completion| Cost millions
table shows the Corps possible congruction Missisiopi Ri

- ississippi River Locks
schedule for the seven locks. The Corps views Todk 20 006 10 5018 323230
these starting dates as an “optimigic” financial Lock 25 2005 2010 2019 $324.40
schedule. Although WRD A 2007 is now law, the Lock 24 2010 014 2022 $309.90
earliest possible Congruction General (CG) Lock 21 2010 014 2022 $322 50
appropriations for NESP will likely not occur Lock 20 2013 2017 2025 $221.40
before FY 2009. CG is a Corps category of lindsWaterway Lodks
funding in for ruction ' '

Peoria 2015 2018 2027, $262.60

category—Preconstruction Engineering and
Des gn (PED)—is necessary for project
development, preliminary engineering analyses,
environmental impact documentation, location surveys, and right-of-way mapping. The Corps has already received
PED funding for three of the locksin 2005. NESP and all other civil works prgj ects are currently under continuing
resolution funding. Proponents of NESP are hopi ng that Congress will include some FY 2008 PED funding for the
project. Nick.Marathon@usda.gov

*- Preconstructi on Ergineering and Design (PED)
Note Thereis no Lock 23.

Trans-Pacific Carriers Claiming Cost Recovery Surcharges

Ocean carriers of containers in the trans-Pacific trade lanes have recently evaluated the differential between their
cost of bunker fuel and the price they charge shippersin the form of a bunker adjustment factor surcharge. The
differenceadded up to $5 billion not recovered by carriers. As aresult of record high oil prices, bunker fuel prices
have increased this year from $295 to $500 per ton. Members of the Trans-Pacific Stabilization Agreement (TSA),
adiscusson group made up of 14 ocean container shipping lines operating inthe Asiato United Statestradel anes,
have agreed to the fol lowi ng cost recovery guidelines, which will take effect immediatel y:

e All new service contracts for the 2008 contract season will be subject to a fl oati ng bunker surcharge in
accordance with TSA’ s bunker formula rather than a fixed surcharge.

e Wherethe volumes of containersto be moved have been met under contract conditions, carriers will seek
an immediate adjustment to bring bunker recovery to a fl oati ng basis for any additional volumes. Some
carriers may seek to accomplish this through appli cation of a separate extraordinary bunker charge.

e Wherethe volumes of containersto be moved have not been met under contract conditions, carriers now
intend to seek mutual agreement with customersto change thefuel surcharge to a new floating basis.

There is aconcern among agricultural shippers that this new palicy, under the cover of confidential service
contracts, will apply more so to export customers than retail i mporters that move larger vol umes and therefore have
more bargaining leverage. The TSA has published bunker adjustment factor surcharges for December which
increased 13 percent over November (See tabl ebelow). April.Taylor@usda.gov

Bunker Adjustment Factorsfor a 20-foot container
Cost per
metric

November | December ton* | % change | $change
Westbound 544 616 31 13% 72
Eastbound 545 615 31 13% 70
*20 metric tons per container
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Grain Transportation Indicators

Table 1
Grain Transport Cost Indicator '

Truck Rail? Barge Ocean
Week ending Gulf Pacific
11/21/07 229 26 226 528 638
11/14/07 230 33 243 514 652

YIndicator: Baseyear 2000 = 100; Weekly updates includetruck = diesel (Wgallon); rail = nearby secondary rail market (¥car);

barge =lllinois River bargerate (index = percent of tariff rate); and ocean = routes to Japan (¥ metric ton)

“Therail indicator is not an index. It is the difference between the nearby secondary rail market bid for this week and the average bid for year 2000
(+) 100.

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/ AMS/USDA

Table2

Market Update: U.S. Originsto Export Postion Price Spreads ($/bushel)

Commodity Origin--Destination 11/16/2007 11/9/2007
Corn IL--Gulf -0.74 -0.74
Corn NE--Gulf -0.86 -0.86
Soybean IA--Gulf -1.13 -1.15
HRW KS--Gulf -1.60 -1.60
HRS ND--Portland -1.33 -1.44

Note: ng = no quote
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programg AMS/USDA

Thegrain bid summary illustrates the market relationships for commodities. Positive and negative adjustmentsin
differential between terminal and futures markets, and the relationship to inland market points, are indicators of
changes in fundamental market supply and demand. The map may be used to monitor market and time differentials.

Figure 1
Grain bid summary
Futures: Week Ago Year Ago
11/16/2007 11/09/2007 11/17/2006
Kansas C ity W ht Dec 7.7450 7.8475 5.1525
Minneapolis W ht Dec 8.2600 8.1800 4.9600
Minneapolis Dur Dec na. n.a. n.a.
Chicago W ht Dec 7.4950 7.6200 4.7400
ot @ #CWRS 7.60 Ch!cago Corn Dec 3.7950 3.8675 3.5500
F_’ rtla #1CWAD 10.41 Chicago Sybn Jan 107775 10.5600 6.6050
HRW  9.02

Sww 1015 HRW.777 Y watLakes»Duluth

HRS 901

corn  NQ HRS 827 HRS  8.38 < oin o
Sybn NQ DUR 1605 ®
(r,tb) MT ND
HRS NQ
DUR  NQ ﬂ;

MN Great Lakes-Toledo

-
Corn 348 can 371 W
@ syon 994 R Syon 10.22 <

A ‘

® kw719 y

Corn 363 7

Sypn  10.32

L ) Elevator Bid

@ Term inal Market (1)

i 30-day to Arrive
<« Pool Return Outlook

(n)=rail, ()= truck, (b)=barge; NQ=No Quote

Inland Bids: 12% HRW, 14% HRS, #1 SRW, #1 DUR, #1SW W, #2 Y Corn, #1 Y Soyb eans
ExportBids: Ord. HRW, 14% HRS, #2 SRW, #2 DUR, #2 SWW, #2 Y Cern, #1 o-yRe ans Gulf-Louisiana

Sources...US. Inland: All (exce pt ND) - Market Ne ws Re port, AMS, USDA (www.usd aamy, gov) i Gulf g";" fﬁ;
ND - Friday Local Cash Gmin Piices, AgW eek, Gran d Forks, ND ybr
U.S. Expoft: Com & Soybean - Export GrainBids, AMS, HRW 895 (b)
USDA W he at Bids - W eekly Whe at Rep ort, U S. W heat Associates, W ash., D.XC. DUR NQ
Canada: Bids in CAN$, Canadian Wh eat Board, Winnipe g (www cwb.ca) gsa ggg
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Rail Transportation

Table3
Rail Déliveriesto Port (carloads)®
M ississippi Cross-Border Pacific Atlantic &

Week ending Gulf ? Texas Gulf M exico Nor thwest East Gulf Total
11/14/2007° 1,515 3,457 879 5,084 1,425 12,360
11/07/2007" 1,563 3,590 927 5,945 1,033 13,058
2007 YTD 52,528 99,861 38,169 196,356 24,773 411,687
2006 YTD 84,635 88,295 41,221 188,024 25651 427,826
2007 YTD &s % of 2006 YTD 62 113 93 104 97 96
Last 4 weeks as % of 2006 * 70 223 109 132 104 127
Last 4 weeks as % of 4-year avg.® % 204 76 127 135 129
Totd 2006 96,593 99,866 45,971 213,682 29,334 485,446
Totd 2005 50,677 99,864 60,879 223,328 15,752 450,500

“Dataisincomplete asit is voluntarily provided; “ Mississ ppi Gulf databack to January, 2004 from several new sourceshas been added
resultingin largeincreasesin the numbers reported; * Compared with same 4-weeks in 2006 and prior 4-year average.

Y TD =year-to-date; p = preliminary data; r = revised data; n/a =not available

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programg AMS/USDA

Railroads originate approximately 35 percent of U.S. grain shipments. Trends in these |oadings are indicative of
market conditions and expectations.

Figure 2

Rail Deliveriesto Port
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TexasGulf: 11/14 -- up 123 % from same period last year; up 104 % from 4-year average

Miss. River: 11/14 -- down 30 % from same period last year; down 6 % from 3-year average

Cross-border Mexico: 11/14-- up 9% from same period last year; down 24 % from 4-year average

Source: Trangportation & Marketing Programs AM S/USDA
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Table4

Class| Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin (grain carloads or iginated)

West U.S. total Canada
Week ending CSXT NS BN SF KCS UP CN CP
11/10/07 3,877 3,740 12,222 737 6,348 26,924 5,267 5,463
Thisweek |ast year 3,770 3,552 10,376 625 5,335 23,658 5,492 5,993
2007 YTD 126,293 144,925 457,955 29,396 251,578 1,010,147 216,868 207,387
2006 YTD 141,879 146,339 444,902 25,381 263,258 1,021,759 223,123 204,012
2007 YTD as % of 2006 YTD 89 99 103 116 96 99 97 102
L ast 4 weeks as % of 2006 99 112 121 125 122 117 99 88
L ast 4 weeks as % of 3-yr avg.* 107 110 124 132 117 118 107 102
Totd 2006 164,056 168,819 515,102 28,629 301,197 1,177,803 258,932 238,765
“As a percent of the same period in 2005 and the prior 3-year average. YTD = year-to-date.
Source: Associ ation of American Railroads (www. aar.org)
Figure 3
Total Weekly U.S Class | Railroad Grain Car Loadings
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Source: A ssoci ation of American Railroads
Table5
Rail Car Auction Offerings' ($/car)?
Week ending Delivery period
11/17/2007 Dec-07 Dec-06 Jan-08  Jan-07 Feb-08 Feb-07 Mar-08 Mar-07
BNS?
CQT grainunits no offer n/a no offer no bid no bids no bid no offer  no bids
COT grainsingle-car’ no offer na no offer 0..1 $0 0..3 $0 no offer
up*
GCAS/Reggion 1 no bids n/a no bids no bid no offer no offer | nooffer no offer
GCAS/Region 2 no offer n/a no bids no bid no offer  no offer | nooffer  no offer

*Auction offeringsare for single-car and unit trai n shipments only.

“Average premium/di scount totariff, last auction

SBNSF - COT = Certificate of Transportation; north grain and south grain bids were combined effecti ve the week ending 6/24/06.

“UP- GCAS= Grain Car Allocation Sysem

Region 1includes AR,IL, LA,MO,NM, OK, TX, WI, and Duluth, MN.

Region 2 includes CO,IA,KS, MN, NE, WY, and KansasCity and St. Joseph, MO.
5Rangeisshtmn because averageis nat available. Not available = n/a.
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programg AMS/ USDA.

Rail service may be ordered directly from the railroad via auction for guaranteed service, or viatariff for
nonguaranteed service, or through the secondary railcar market.
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The secondary rail market information reflects trade values for service that was originally purchased from the
railroad carrier as some form of guaranteed freight. The auction and secondary rail values are indicators of rail
service quality and demand/supply.

Figure 4
BidgOffersfor Railcarsto beDelivered in December 2007, Secondary Market
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Figure 5
BidgOffersfor Railcarsto beDelivered in January 2008, Secondary M arket
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Figure 6

BidgOffersfor Railcarsto beDelivered in February 2008, Secondary M ar ket
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Table6
Weekly Secondary Rail Car Market ($/car)*
Week ending Ddivery period
11/17/2007 Dec-07 Jan-08 Feb-08 Mar-08 Apr-08 May-08
Non-shuttle
BN SF-GF 30 25 n‘a -25 n/a n/‘a
Change from last week 5 0 n/a -25 n/a n‘a
Change from same week 2006 116 67 n/a n/a n/a n/a
UP-Pool -169 -50 n‘a n/a n/a n‘a
Change from last week -19 0 n/a n‘a n/a n/a
Change from same week 2006 12 75 n/a n‘a n/a n‘a
Shuttle”
BN SF-GF -275 -225 n/a n/a n/a n/a
Change from | ast week n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
Change from same week 2006 -104 -25 n/a n/a n/a n/a
UP-Pool n/‘a n‘a n‘a n/a n/a n‘a
Change from last week n‘a n‘a n/a n‘a na n/a
Change from same week 2006 n/a na n/a n‘a n/a n/a

tAverage premi um/di scount totariff, $/car-last week
“Shuttle bids are anew datasaies prior to this we provided only non-shuttle rates.

Note: Bidsliged are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guaranteed prices,

n/a= not available; GF = guaranteed frei ght; Podl = guaranteed pool
Sources: Trangportation and Marketing Programs/AMS/USDA
Data from Atwood/ConAgra, Harvest States Co-op, JamesB. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.
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Table7

Tariff Rail Ratesfor Unit and Shuttle Train Shipments

Effective date: As % of same Rateper  Rateper
11/5/2007 Origin region Destination r egion Rate/lcar month last year metric ton bushel*
Unit train”
Wheat Chicago, IL Albany, NY $2,322 107 $25.60 $0.70
Kansas City, MO Galveston, TX $2,273 107 $25.06 $0.68
South Central, KS Galveston, TX $2,820 106 $31.08 $0.85
Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $3,214 106 $35.43 $0.96
St. Louis, MO Houston, TX $2,730 107 $30.09 $0.82
South Central, ND Houston, TX $4,649 102 $51.25 $1.39
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,840 100 $42.33 $1.15
South Central, ND Portland, OR $3,840 100 $42.33 $1.15
Northwest, KS Portland, OR $4,590 100 $50.60 $1.38
Chicago, IL Richmond, VA $2,353 99 $25.94 $0.71
Com Chicago, IL Baton Rouge, LA $3,260 116 $35.93 $0.91
Council Bluffs, IA Baton Rouge, LA $3,107 116 $34.25 $0.87
Kansas City, MO Dalhart, TX $3204 110 $35.32 $0.90
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,350 103 $36.93 $0.94
Evansville, IN Raleigh, NC $2,708 121 $29.85 $0.76
Columbus, OH Raleigh, NC $2,597 123 $28.63 $0.73
Council Bluffs, A Stockton, CA $5,280 104 $58.20 $1.48
Soybeans Chicago, IL Baton Rouge, LA $3,309 116 $36.47 $0.99
Council Bluffs, A Baton Rouge, LA $3,156 116 $34.79 $0.95
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,060 100 $43.65 $1.19
Evansville, IN Raleigh, NC $2,708 121 $29.85 $0.81
Chicago, IL Raleigh, NC $3,308 117 $36.46 $0.99
Shuttle Train
Wheat St Louis, MO Houston, TX $2.212 115 $24.38 $0.66
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3540 100 $39.02 $1.06
Com Fremont, NE Hougton, TX $2,448 108 $26.98 $0.69
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,348 106 $36.90 $0.94
Soybeans Council Bluffs, A Houston, TX $2,612 108 $28.79 $0.78
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,503 106 $38.61 $1.05

“A unit train refers to shipments of at least 52 cars  Shuttl etrain rates are available for qualified shipmentsof
75-110 cars that meet rail road effi ciency requirements.
“Approximateload per car = 100 short tons(90.72metric tons): corn’56 Ibs./bu., wheat & soybeans 60 |bs./bu.

Sources: www.bnsf.com, WWW.Cpr.ca, Www.csx.com, wWww. uprr.com
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Table8
Tariff Rail Ratesf

or U.S. Bulk Grain Shipmentsto U.S.-M exico Border Crossings

Effective date: 11/5/07 As% of
Origin  Border Train Tariff samemonth  Rateper Rate per
Commodity date crossingregion sze rate’ lagt year metricton  bushel®
Wheat KS Brownsville, TX Shuttle $3,364 114 $34.37 $0.93
ND Eagle Pass TX Unit $4,791 107 $48.95 $1.33
OK El Paso, TX Shuttle $2,327 104 $23.78 $0.65
OK El Paso, TX Unit $2904 114 $29.67 $0.81
AR Laredo, TX Unit $2,729 105 $27.88 $0.76
IL Laredo, TX Unit $3,855 113 $39.39 $1.07
MT Laredo, TX Shuttle $3,980 100 $40.67 $1.11
TX Laredo, TX Shuttle $2,610 115 $26.67 $0.73
MO Laredo, TX Shuttle $3232 114 $33.02 $0.90
wi Laredo, TX Unit $4,094 113 $41.83 $1.14
Corn NE Brownsville, TX Shuttle $4,318 115 $44.12 $1.12
NE Brownsville, TX Unit $4.217° 105 $43.09 $1.09
IA Eagle Pass TX Unit $4570 115 $46.69 $1.18
MO Eagle Pass TX Shuttle $4,066'* 106 $41.54 $1.05
NE Eagle Pass TX Shuttle $4,466'1 110 $45.63 $1.16
IA Laredo, TX Shuttle $4,486 115 $45.84 $1.16
Soybean 1A Brownsville, TX Shuttle $4,167 118 $42.58 $1.16
MN Brownsville, TX Shuttle $4,365 117 $44.60 $1.21
NE Brownsville, TX Shuttle $3,958 118 $40.44 $1.10
NE Eagle Pass TX Shuttle $4,041 118 $41.29 $1.12
IA Laredo, TX Unit $4,209 118 $43.01 $1.17
LA unit train refers to shipments of at |east 52 cars Shuttletrain are avail abl e for qualifi ed shipments of 75-110 cars
that meet railroad efficiency requirenents
Ratesare based upon published tariff rates for high-capacity rail cars
3Approxi mate load per car = 97.87 metric tons Corn 56 Ibg'bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 Ibs/bu
4Highcapacily rate not available, rate estimated using published | ow-capacity tariff rate x 1.08
Sources: www.bnsf.com, www. uprr.com
Figure?7
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Barge Transportation

Figure 8
lllinois River Barge Freight Rate'?
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'Rate= percent of 1976 tari ff benchmark index (1976 = 100 percent); %4-week movi ng average of the 3-year average.
Source: Transportation & Marketing Prograng AMS/USDA
Table9
Weekly Barge Freight Rates: Southbound Only
Twin Mid- Illinois L ower Cairo-
Cities Misdssppi River St. Louis Cincinnati Ohio  Memphis
Rate' 11/20/2007 453 13 406 324 369 369 297
11/13/2007 480 436 438 358 424 415 327
$ton 11/20/2007 28.06 2197 18.84 1293 1731 14.91 9.33
11/13/2007 2971 23.20 2032 1428 19.89 16.77 10.27
Current week % change from the same week:
Lastyear - -12 -13 -15 -2 -2 7
3-year avg. 2 2 3 3 -4 4 4 5
Rate' D ecember - - 24 333 369 369 305
February - - 415 Al 369 369 309

IRate = percent of 1976 tari ff benchmark index (1976 = 100 percent); 24-week moving average; ton = 2,000 pounds
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs AMS/USDA

Figure 9
Benchmark tariff rates

Calculating bargerate per ton:
(Index * 1976 tariff benchmark rate per ton)/100

Select applicable index from market quotes included in tables
onthispage. The 1976 benchmark rates per ton are provided
in map (seefigure 9).

GTR 10 November 22, 2007



Figure 10
Bar ge M ovements on the Mississippi River * (Locks 27 - Granite City, IL)
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*The 3-year averageis a 4-week moving average.

Source: U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (www.mvr.usace. army.mil/mvri mi/omni iwebrpts/default.asp)

Table 10
Bar ge Grain Movements(1,000 tons)
Week ending 11/17/2007 Corn Wheat Soybeans Other Total
M ississippi River
Rock Island, IL (L15) 332 9 75 0 416
Winfidd, MO (L25) 398 0 95 0 493
Alton, IL (L26) 770 6 117 0 894
Granite City, IL (L27) 762 6 115 0 883
Illinois River (L 8) 313 3 6 0 323
OhioRiver (L52) 123 6 32 0 162
Arkansas River (L1) 0 7 22 2 31
Weekly totd - 2007 885 19 170 2 1,076
Weekly totd - 2006 708 9 183 13 913
2007 YTD! 22,091 1,593 5,403 501 29,588
2006 YTD 23,591 1,342 6,398 618 31,950
2007 as % of 2006 YTD 94 119 84 81 93
L ast 4 weeks as % of 2006 135 174 62 90 115
Totd 2006 27,439 1,442 7,733 719 37,332

1Week|yt0ta|, YTD (year-to-date) and calendar year total includes Misg27, Ohio/52, and Ark/1; "Other" refersto oats barley, sorghum, and rye.
“As apercent of same period in2006.

Note: Total may not add exactly, duetorounding

Source: U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (www.mvr.usace.army.mil/mvri mi/omni /w ebrpts/default.asp)
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Figure 11
Upbound Empty Barges Transiting Mississippi River Locks 27, Arkansas River Lock

and Dam 1, and Ohio River Locks and Dam 52
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Source: Army Corpsof Engineers

Figure 12
Grain Bargesfor Export in New Orleans Region
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Source: Army Corpsof Engineers and GIPSA
Note: Duetodatarestructuring of grainbargesunloaded inNew Orleans, the week ending May 19 represents 6 days of data.
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Truck Transportation

The weekly diesel price provides aproxy for trendsin U.S. truck rates. Diesel fuel isasignificant expense for
truck grain movements, accounting for 37 percent of the estimated variable cost.

Table11
Retail on-Highway Diesel Prices’, W eek Ending 11/19/07 (US$/gallon)
Change from
Region L ocation Price Week ago Y ear ago
I East Coast 3.407 -0.008 0.886
New England 3.488 0.004 0.863
Centrd Atlantic 3.524 0.001 0.886
Lower Atlantic 3.350 -0.012 0.889
1] Midwest? 3.389 -0.014 0.835
I Gulf Coast® 3.324 -0.023 0.855
v Rocky Mountain 3.507 -0.025 0.860
\Y, West Coast 3.586 -0.022 0.862
Cdifornia 3.624 -0.039 0.934
Total us. 3.410 -0.015 0.857

Diesd fuel pricesinclude all taxes Prices represent anaverage of all types of diesel fuel.
Same as North Central  *Same as South Central
Source: Enegy Information Adminigration/U.S. Department of Energy (www.eia.doe.gov)

Figure 13
Weekly Diesd Fue Prices, U.S. Average
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Source: Retail On-Highway Diesel Prices, Energy Information Administration, Dept. of Energy
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Grain Exports

Table12
U.S. Export Balances and Cumulative Exports (1,000 metric tons)
Wheat Corn Soybeans Total
Week endi ngl HRW SRW HRS SWW DUR All wheat
Export Balances
11/8/2007 4,718 994 2,660 1,391 362 10,126 18,642 8,440 37,208
Thisweek year ago 1,593 466 1,078 1,083 107 4327 11,944 7,080 23,351
Cumulative expor ts-marketing y ear 2
2007/08 YTD 6,851 3,706 3,709 2075 544 16,886 12,044 6,008 34,938
2006/07 YTD 2,473 1,665 2,966 2,099 417 9,620 11,166 7,624 28,410
Y TD 2007/08 as % of 2006/07 277 223 125 99 130 176 108 79 123
L ast 4 wks as % of same period 2006/07 319 218 266 136 338 250 158 115 162
2006/07 Totd 6,800 3,866 6,480 4,996 761 22,902 53,799 30,261 106,962
2005/06 Totd 10459 2,037 7,244 4159 930 24,828 54,354 25,570 104,752
! Current unshipped export salesto date
“ Shipped export sales to date; new marketing year now in effect for corn and soybeans sales
Note: YTD =year-to-date. MarketingY ear: wheat = 6/01-5/31, corn & soybeans = 9/01-8/31
Source: Foreign Agricultural ServicelUSDA (www.fasusda.gov)
Table 13
Top 5 Importers' of U.S. Corn
Week ending 11/08/07 Total Commitments’ % change Exports’
2007/08 2006/07 current MY
Current MY Lags MY | fromlas MY 2006/07
- 1,000 mt - -1,000mt -
Japan’ 7,722 7,078 9 15,640
Mexico 5,158 4,329 19 9,114
Taiwan 1,550 2,006 (23) 4,517
Korea® 3,105 1,520 104 4,079
Egypt® 1,678 %68 73 3,508
Top 5importers 19,213 15,902 21 36,858
Total US corn export sales 30,686 23,110 33
Change from Last Week 1,364 1,396
Top 5importers' share of U.S.
corn export sales 63% 69%
USDA forecast, November 2007 59,690 53,850 11
CornUsefor Ethanol USDA
forecast, November 2007 81,280 53,720 51

(n) indi cates negative number.

!B ased on FAS 2006/07 Marketing Year Ranking Reports - www.fas usda. gov; Marketing year (MY) =Sep 1 - Aug 31.
2Cumulative Exports (shipped) + Outstanding Sales (unshi pped), FAS Weekly Export Sales Report.

8 FASMarketing Y ear Final Reports - www. fas usda. gov/export-sal esmyfi_rpt.htm.
#Not included - FAS Press Release 11/14 : 106,680 mt to Japan for 2007/08.

®Nat included - FAS Press Release 11/20: 374,000mtto S. K oreafor 2007/08.
®Not included - FAS Press Release 11/14: 180,000 mtto Egypt for 2007/08.
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Table 14
Top 5 Importers1 of U.S. Soybeans

Week ending 11/08/07 Total Commitments’ % change Exports3
2007/08 2006/07 current MY
Current MY Lag MY | fromlastMY 2006/07
- 1,000 mt - - 1,000 mt -
China' 7,060 6,212 14 11,455
Mexico 1,368 1,262 8 3,854
Japan 1,393 1,279 9 3,159
EU-25 940 1,272 (26) 3,651
Taiwan 564 805 (30) 1,942
Top 5importers 11,325 10,830 5 23,960
Total US soybean export sales 14,448 14,704 (2)
Change from last week 1,296 747
Top 5importers' share of U.S.
soybean export sales 78% 74%
USDA forecast, November 2007 26,540 30,345 (13)

(n) indicates negative number.

'Based on FAS 2006/07 Marketi ng Y ear Ranking Reports - www.fas.usda.gov; M arketing year (MY) = Sep 1 - Aug 31.
2Cumulative Exports (shipped) + Outstanding Sales (unshi pped), FAS Weekly Export Sales Report.
3 FASMarketi ng Y ear Final Reports - www.fas usda. gov/export-sal ed myfi_rpt.htm.
*Not included - FAS Press Releases 886,000 mt to China (115,000 mt on11/09; and 107,000 mt on 11/13; 110,000 mt on
11/15; 226,000 mt on 11/16; 221,000 mt on 11/19, and 107,000 mt on 11/20) for 2007/08.

Table 15

Top 10 Importer s' of All U.S. W heat

Week ending 11/08/07 Total Commitments” % change Exports’
2007/08 2006/07 current MY
Current MY LastMY | fromlag MY 2006/07
-1,000 mt - - 1,000 mt -
Japan 1,845 1,785 3 3,533
Nigeria 1,233 1,169 5 2,594
Mexico 1,840 1,314 40 2,220
Egypt 2,608 1,160 125 2,092
Philippines 1,533 1,307 17 1,739
Korea, South 1,008 720 40 1,195
Taiwan 726 487 49 1,001
Iraq 1,907 700 172 799
Y emen 866 461 88 709
Algeria 1,222 123 891 160
Top 10 importers 12,942 7,442 74 16,041
Total USwheat export sales 27,012 13,948 94 23,789
Change from lagt week 416 323

Top 10 importers share of
U.S. wheat export sales 48% 53%
USDA forecast, November 2007 31,300 24,740 27

(n) indicates nggative number.

'Based on FAS 2006/07 Marketi ng Y ear Ranking Reports (except Algeria) - www .fas.usdagov; Marketing year = Jun 1 - May 31
2Cumulative Exports (shipped) + Outstanding Sales (unshipped), FAS Weekly Export Sales Report.
®FASMarketing Y ear Final Reports - www. fas usda gov/export-sal esmyfi_rpt. htm.
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Table 16
Grain Inspections for Export by U.S. Port Region (1,000 metric tons)

Port Week ending 2007 YTD as | Lag 4-weeksas % of Total*
regions 11/15/07 | 2007 YTD'| 2006 YTD" [% of 2006 YTD| 2006 3yr. avg. 2006
Pacific Northwest
Wheat 218 10,554 9,608 110 186 118 11,083
Corn 216 7,847 8,625 91 135 141 9,556
Soybeans 159 6,314 5,262 120 96 o7 6,049
Total 594 24,716 234A 105 132 110 26,688
Missssppi Gulf
W heat 127 5,907 3,776 156 123 131 4,124
Corn 850 30,410 31,903 95 114 121 35,462
Soybeans 408 11,826 13,220 89 66 62 16,222
Total 1,385 48,143 48,898 98 A 95 55,808
Texas Gulf
W heat 171 7,636 4,581 167 368 226 5,078
Corn 0 1,093 2,469 44 44 9 3,055
Soybeans 0 76 124 61 0 0 153
Total 171 8,84 7,173 123 162 182 8,286
Great Lakes
Wheat 108 2,357 1,250 189 459 229 1,382
Corn 29 682 1,525 45 142 86 1,701
Soybeans 0 382 840 45 29 37 1,113
Total 137 3,421 3,615 95 95 4,196
Atlantic
W heat 18 1,164 616 189 282 592 686
Corn 0 488 647 75 4 119 736
Soybeans 25 354 421 84 53 31 621
Total 44 2,005 1,684 119 A 3 2,043
U.S. total from ports®
Wheat 643 25,260 18,581 136 223 159 22,354
Corn 1,096 40,521 45,169 0 111 121 50,509
Soybeans 592 18,951 19,866 95 67 64 24,157
Total 2,331 84,732 83,616 101 108 104 97,020

Y Includes weekly revid ons, someregional totals may not add exactly duetorounding.
2Total includes only port regions shown above
Source: Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Administration/USDA (www.gipsa.usda.gov); Y TD= year-to-date n/a=not applicable

The United States exports approximately one-quarter of the grain it produces. On average, it includes nearly 45 percent of U.S.-grown wheat,
35 percent of U.S.-grown soybeans, and 20 percent of the U.S.-grown corn. Approximately 57 percent of these U.S. export grain shipments
departed through the Mississippi Gulf region in 2006.
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Figure 14
U.S. grain inspected for export (wheat, corn, and soybeans)
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Source: Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Administration/USDA (www.gipsa.usda.gov)
Note: 3-year average condsts of 4-week running average

Figure 15

Weekly U.S. Grain Inspections U.S. Gulf and PNW (wheat, cor n, and soybeans)
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Source: Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Administration/U SDA (www.gipsausda.gov)

Nov 15: % changefrom: MS Gulf IX Gulf U.S culf PNW

Last week up 14 down 33 up 6 down2

Last year (same week) up 11 down 6 up 9 up 9

3-yravg (4-wk mov. avg.) w4 up 7 up 4 down 0.3
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Ocean Transportation

Table 17
Weekly Port Region Grain Ocean Vessl Activity (number of vessds)
Padific Vancouver
Gulf Northwest B.C.
Loaded Due next
Date In port 7-days 10-days Inport In port
11/15/2007 44 59 68 11 10
11/8/2007 51 40 70 7 8
2006 range (16..40) (31..56) (45..81) (1.17) (2.13)
2006 avg. 27 42 58 8 7

Source: Transportation & Marketing PrograngAMS/USDA

Figure 16
U.S. Gulf" Vessel Loading Activity
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Figure 17
Grain Vessd Rates, U.S. to Japan
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Table18
Ocean Freight Rates For Seected Shipments, W eek Ending 11/17/2007
Export Impor t Grain L oading Volume loads Freight rate
region region ty pes date (metric tons) (US$/metric ton)
U.S. Gulf Algeria W heat Oct 20/ Nov 5 30,000 90.50
U.S. Gulf Algeria Corn Oct 20/30 40,000 80.00
U.S. Gulf China Grans Nov 5/10 55,000 115.00
U.S. Gulf Peru W heat Oct 25/Nov 5 11,500 145.29
U.S. Gulf Nicaragua W heat Nov 20/30 15,000 144 87
U.S. Gulf Algeria Miaze/Soybean M Nov 14/21 16,000 130.00
U.S. Gulf Morocco Hvy Grain Oct 5/10 25,000 85.00
U.S. Gulf Djibouti* W heat Nov 26/Dec 6 9,080 165.83
River Plate Algeria Hvy Grain Oct 18/25 30,000 56.50
River Plate Turkey Soybean Meal Oct /15 18,000 98.00
River Plate United Kingdom Gran Oct 10/20 37,500 94 .50

Rates shown arefor metric ton (2,204.621bs =1 metricton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicates op= option
175 percent of food aid from the United States is required to be shippedon U.S-flag vessels
Source: Maritime Research Inc. (www.maritime-research.com)
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Figure 18
Ocean Rates' for Containerized Shipmentsto Selected Asian Countries
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'Ratesare wei ghted by shipping line market share and desti nation courtry. Rates provided are publicly filed tariff rates, not those

negotiated in aconfidential service contract.

Countries include: Animal Feed: Bangkok-Thailand (1%), Busan-Korea (30%), Hong Kong (17%), Kaohs ung/Keel ung-Taiwan (32%),

Tokyo-Japan (20%). Soybeans: Kaohsiung/Keelung-Taiwan (98%), Tokyo-Japan (2%)
Source: Ocean Rate Bulletin, Quarter 3, 2007, Transportation& Marketing Programg AMS/USDA

Container ocean freight rates — average rate per twenty-foot equivalent unit (TEU) weighted by shipping line

market share and trade route.

During 2006, containers were used to transport 3 percent of total U.S. grain exported, and 5 percent of total U.S.

grain exported to Asia.

Figure 19
Monthly Shipments of Containerized Grain to Asia
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