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| ce Build-up Slows Barge Traffic

Due to several feet of ice build-up on the interior wall of the main chamber at Mississippi River Melvin
Price Locks and Dam (also known as L ocks and Dam 26), awidth restriction of 89 feet isin effect until
further notice. Barges are generally 35 feet wide and are assembled in tows with three barges tied
together side-by-side. With the restriction, only 2 of the 35-foot barges can be lashed together. This
reduces the capacity of thelock. Ice accumulations have also limited barge operations on the Illinois
River.

Pace of Grain Barge Unloadings Remains Strong in New Orleans

The number of grain bar ges unloaded in New Orleansincreased this week to 759 barges—10 percent
higher than the previous week. Although barge grain shipments have been below average, nearly 700
barges aweek have unloaded in New Orleans since the beginning of the year. Also, an industry
representative reported that grain was being stored in barges in New Orleans until recently.

Number of Empty Upbound Bar ges Decr eases

Empty upbound barges passing through Locks and Dam 27 decreased this week to 121 barges, 25 percent
lower than the previous week. The total number of barges traveling up river decreased to 147, with 82
percent of them empty.

Snapshot by Sector

I nspections
For the week ending February 8, corn inspectionsincreased 11 percent to 0.884 million mt. Wheat
inspections dropped 44 percent to 0.338 mmt, and soybeans 26 percent to 0.675 mmit.

Barge
For the week ending February 10, bar ge volumes were 389 thousand tons, a decrease of 6 percent from
the previous week.

Ocean
During the week ending February 8, 45 grain vessels were loaded in the U.S. Gulf, unchanged from this
time last year. Sixty-eight vessels were due within the next 10 days, 17 percent higher than last year.

Fuel
During the week ending February 12, the average U.S. diesel fuel priceincreased $.04 to $2.48 per
gallon, unchanged from thistime last year.



http://www.ams.usda.gov/tmdtsb/grain/Mexico/Mexico2006.htm
http://www.ams.usda.gov/tmdtsb/grain/QuarterlyUpdates/QuarterlyUpdates2006.htm
http://www.ams.usda.gov/tmdtsb/grain
mailto:GTRContactUs@USDA.gov
http://www.ams.usda.gov/tmdtsb/grain/Brazil%202006/Brazil2006.htm

Feature Article/Calendar

Fourth Quarter Grain Inspections Up. During the fourth quarter 2006, the Grain Inspection, Stockyards and
Packers Administration (GIPSA) inspected 30.92 million metric tons (mmt) of grain (wheat, corn, and
soybeans) for export at major U.S. ports (figure 1), 3 percent higher than the fourth quarter 2005 and 1 percent
higher than the 5-year average. U.S. Gulf grain inspections increased 5 percent over last year, to 18.59 mmt.,
primarily caused by increased corn and
soybean inspections. Total fourth quarter
Pacific Northwest (PNW) grain
Inspections were 7.02 mmt, 9 percent
lower than last year but 8 percent higher
than the 5-year average. Fourth quarter
East Coast/Gresat Lakes total grain
inspections decreased 1 percent from last
year and 10 percent from the 5-year
average, at 2.22 mmt. According to the
Foreign Agricultural Service (FAS), total
Al PIW. ot ey year-to-date (YTD) grain (wheat, corn,
and soybeans) exports through November
increased 12 percent over last year to
99.34 mmt. Exports to Japan (+9%),

Figure 1 - Fourth Quarter Grain Inspections by Ports

Millions of metric tons

Source: USDA/GIPSA

Mexico (+14%), and China (+12%) contributed to the increase.

Total Soybean and Corn Inspections Up; Wheat Down. Fourth quarter soybean inspections rebounded from
last year, increasing 16 percent to 11.73 mmt (figure 2), due to a 21 percent increasein U.S. Gulf soybean
inspections and a 17 percent increase in the East Coast/Great Lakes region. PNW fourth quarter soybean
inspections dropped slightly from last year. According to FAS, Y TD soybean exports increased 8 percent from
last year to 25.04 mmt, helped by increased sales to Mexico, Japan, and China.

Fourth quarter corn inspections
tOtalaj 13.81 mmt tOﬂS, 11 pefcent Figure 2 - Fourth Quarter Grain Inspections by Types
higher than last year (figure 2). The
increase was led by a 15 percent
increasein U.S. Gulf corn inspections
(9.78 mmt), and increased demand
from Mexico and South America.
Fourth quarter PNW corn inspections,
at 1.66 mmt, decreased 24 percent
from last year due to slowing Asian
demand. Total fourth quarter wheat

W2005
H2006

Millions of metric tons

inspections totaled 5.39 mmt, 27 Corn Wheat Soybeans
percent lower than last year (figure
2)1 mai nly dueto a44 percent Source: USDA/GIPSA

decrease in Gulf inspections. Lower

U.S. fourth quarter inspections for export could be attributed to asmaller U.S. crop and lower demand.
Increased wheat production in other countries, such as Russia and the European Union, have contributed al so.
Johnny.Hill @usda.gov
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Grain Transportation Indicators

Tablel
Grain Transport Cost Indicators'

Truck Rail® Barge Ocean®
Week ending Gulf Pacific
02/14/07 166 45 202 n/a n/a
02/07/07 163 -17 199 n/a n/a

Yndicator: Base year 2000 = 100; Weekly updates include truck = diesdl ($/gallon); rail = nearby secondary rail market ($/car);

barge = spot l1lInois River basis (Index = percent ot tarift rate); and ocean = routes to Japan ($/metric ton)

“Therail indicator is not an index. It isthe difference between the nearby secondary rail market bid for this week and the average bid for year 2000
(+) 100.

“Data for these routes has been suspended by the Baltic Exchange, Inc. Alternate sources of data are currently being explored

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AM SUSDA

Market Update: U.S. Originsto Export Position Price Spreads ($/bushel)

Commodity Origin--Destination 2/9/2007 2/2/2007
Corn IL--Gulf -0.65 -0.59
Corn NE--Gulf -0.71 -0.63
Soybean 1A--Gulf -0.96 -0.93
HRW KS--Gulf -0.91 -0.92
HRS ND--Portland -1.34 -1.26

Note: ng = no quote
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AMS/USDA

Thegrain bid summary illustrates the market relationships for commodities. Positive and negative adjustments in
differential between terminal and futures markets, and the relationship to inland market points, are indicators of
changes in fundamental market supply and demand. The map may be used to monitor market and time differentials.

Figure 1
Grain bid summary

Futures: WeekAgo Year Ago
2/09/2007 2/02/2007 2/10/2006
Kansas City W ht M ar 4.8500 4.8700 4.3000
Minneapolis W ht Mar 4.9650 4.9300 4.1000
M inneapolis Dur M ar n.a. n.a. n.a.
Chicago W ht M ar 4.6025 4.6125 3.5525
<, @3 #ICWRS 5.89 Chicago Corn M ar 4.0625 4.0200 2.2125
Paortl #1CWAD  5.97 Chicago Sybn Mar 7.4925 7.3675 5.8225

HRW  5.79 °
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(n=rail, ()=truck, (b)=barge; NQ=No Quote

Inland Bids: 12% HRW, 14% HRS,#1 SRW, #1 DUR, #1 SWW , #2 Y Corn, #1 Y Soybeans
ExportBids: Ord. HRW, 14% HRS, #2 SRW, #2 DUR, #2 SWW , #2 Y Clan, #1 oyheans

2=
Sources...U.S.Inland: All (except ND) - Market News Report, AMS, USDA (www.usda.amX.gov) _._ Gulf Corn 4.50
ND - Friday Local Cash Grain Prices, AQW eek, Grand Forks, ND Sybn 7.81
U.S.Export: Corn & Soybean - Export Grain Bids, AMS, HRW 5.61 (b)
USDA W heat Bids - Weekly Wheat Report, U.S. W heat Associates, W ash., D.g DUR NA
Canada: Bids in CANS$, Canadian W heat Board, W innipeg (www.cwb.ca) gF?vSv 5A081
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Rail Transportation

Table 3
Rail Deliveriesto Port (carloads)*

Mississippi Cross-Border Pacific Atlantic &
Week ending Gulf 2 Texas Gulf M exico Northwest  East Gulf Total
2/07/2007 1,359 1,067 424 4,193 309 7,352
1/31//2007° 2,006 1,571 945 4,874 916 10,312
2007 YTD 11,108 8,866 3,230 28,399 3,752 55,355
2006 YTD 11,586 14,070 3,681 24,720 2,854 56,911
2007 YTD as % of 2006 YTD 9% 63 88 115 131 97
Last 4 weeks as % of 2006 ° 81 56 87 114 131 92
Last 4 weeks as % of 4-year avg.’ na 66 73 115 106 n'a
Total 2006 96,593 99,866 45971 213,682 29,334 485,446
Total 2005 50,677 99,864 60,879 223,328 15,752 450,500

*Dataisincomplete asit is voluntarily provided; “ Mississippi Gulf data back to January, 2004 from several new sources has been added
resulting in large increases in the numbers reported; * Compared with same 4-weeksin 2006 and prior 4-year average.

YTD =year-to-date; p = preliminary data; r = revised data; n/a = not available

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AM S'USDA

Railroads originate approximately 35 percent of U.S. grain shipments. Trends in these |oadings are indicative of
market conditions and expectations.

Figure 2
Rail Deliveriesto Port
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= = = Pacific Northwest: 4 Wks. ending 2/07-- up 14% from same period last year; up 15% from 4-year average
Texas Gulf: 2/07 -- down 44% from same period last year; down 34% from 4-year average

Miss. River: 2/07 -- down 19% from same period last year; 4-year average not available

Cross-border Mexico: 2/07 -- down 13% from same period last year; down 27% from 4-year average

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AMS/USDA
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Table4

Class| Rail Carrier Grain Car Bulletin (grain carloads originated)

East West U.S. total Canada
Week ending CSXT NS BNSF KCS UP CN CP
02/03/07 2,685 3,341 9,805 534 5,510 21,875 4,562 4,576
This week last year 3,351 3,622 10,795 623 5,549 23,940 4,615 4,492
2007 YTD 15,418 16,079 51,680 2,874 24,837 110,888 24,671 22,148
2006 YTD 16,954 16,937 51,486 3,036 31,217 119,630 24,872 22,124
2007 YTD as % of 2006 YTD 91 95 100 95 80 93 99 100
Last 4 weeks as % of 2006 89 97 100 97 80 93 95 95
Last 4 weeks as % of 3-yr avg.* 97 92 109 85 81 97 103 113
Total 2006 164,056 168,819 515,102 28,629 301,197 1,177,803 258,932 238,765
*As a percent of the same period in 2005 and the prior 3-year average. YTD = year-to-date.
Source: Association of American Railroads (www.aar.org)
Figure 3
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Source: Association of American Railroads
Table5
Rail Car Auction Offerings' ($/car)?
Week ending Delivery period
2/10/2007 Feb-07 Feb-06 Mar-07 Mar-06 Apr-07 Apr-06 May-07 May-06
BNSF®
COT grain units no offer n/a no bid no offer no bid no offer no bid no bid
COT grain single-car no offer n/a 0 n/a $0 n/a no bid n/a
up*
GCAS/Region 1 no bid n/a no bid no offer no bid nobid | nooffer no offer
GCAS/Region 2 no bid n/a no bid no offer no bid no bid no offer  no offer

*Auction offerings are for single-car and unit train shipments only.
2Average premiumy/discount to tariff, last auction

3BNSF - COT = Certificate of Transportation; N. grain and S. grain bids were combined effective the week ending 6/24/06.

*UP- GCAS = Grain Car Allocation System

Region 1includes: AR, IL, LA, MO, NM, OK, TX, WI, and Duluth, MN.
Region 2 includes: CO, IA, KS, MN, NE, WY, and Kansas City and St. Joseph, MO.
®Range s shown becalise average is not available. Not available = n/a

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AMSUSDA. n/a = not applicable

Rail service may be ordered directly from the railroad via auction for guaranteed service, or viatariff for
nonguaranteed service, or through the secondary railcar market.

GTR
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The secondary rail market information reflects trade values for service that was originally purchased from the
railroad carrier as some form of guaranteed freight. The auction and secondary rail values are indicators of
rail service quality and demand/supply.

Figure 4
Bids/Offersfor Railcarsto be Delivered in February 2007, Secondary M ar ket

= Non-shuttle bids/offers rose $62 from last week and are $5 below the peak.
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Non-shuttle bids include unit-train and single-car bids.
Excluded 2006 from the 3-year non-shuttle average due to abnormally high rates following Hurricanes Katrina and Rita.
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AM SUSDA

Figure 5
Bidg/Offersfor Railcarsto be Delivered in March 2007, Secondary Mar ket
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Excluded 2006 from the 3-year non-shuttle average due to abnormally high rates following Hurricanes Katrina and Rita.
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AMS/USDA

GTR 6 February 15, 2007



Figure 6

Bids/Offersfor Railcarsto be Delivered in April 2007, Secondary M ar ket
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Table6
Weekly Secondary Rail Car Market ($/car)*
Week ending Delivery period
2/10/2007 Feb-07 Mar-07 Apr-07 M ay-07 Jun-07 Jul-07
Non-shuttle
BNSF-GF -50 -53 -63 -50 -45 n/a
Change from last week -18 -15 -5 5 0 n/a
Change from same week 2006 -25 -32 -38 -6 -14 n/a
UP-Pool n/a -206 -200 -200 -125 -83
Change from last week n/a -9 -12 -12 0 0
Change from same week 2006 n/a -164 -130 -130 -55 -83
Shuttle’
BNSF-GF -235 -213 -250 -250 -213 -213
Change from last week -47 -13 0 0 n/a n/a
Change from same week 2006 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
UP-Pool -250 -250 n/a n/a n/a n/a
Change from last week -62 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
Change from same week 2006 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

! Average premiumy/discount to tariff, $/car-last week
ZShuttle bids are a new data series; prior to this we provided only non-shuttle rates.

Note: Bidslisted are market INDICATORS only & are NOT guaranteed prices,

Missing value = n/a; GF = guaranteed freight; Pool = guaranteed pool
Sources. Transportation and Marketing Programs/AM S/USDA
Data from Atwood/ConAgra, Harvest States Co-op, James B. Joiner Co., Tradewest Brokerage Co.
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Table7

Tariff Rail Ratesfor Unit and Shuttle Train Shipments1

Effective date: As % of same Rateper  Rate per
2/5/2007 Origin region Destination region Rate/car month last year ~ metricton bushel*
Unit train®
Wheat Chicago, IL Albany, NY $2,175 117 $23.97 $0.65
Kansas City, MO Galveston, TX $2,120 105 $23.37 $0.64
South Central, KS Galveston, TX $2,650 108 $29.21 $0.80
Minneapolis, MN Houston, TX $3,020 125 $33.29 $0.91
St Louis, MO Houston, TX $2,560 108 $28.22 $0.77
South Central, ND Houston, TX $3,749 89 $41.32 $1.12
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,840 97 $42.33 $1.15
South Central, ND  Portland, OR $3,840 97 $42.33 $1.15
Northwest, KS Portland, OR $4,590 102 $50.60 $1.38
Chicago, IL Richmond, VA $2,383 110 $26.27 $0.71
Corn Chicago, IL Baton Rouge, LA $2,810 108 $30.97 $0.79
Council Bluffs, 1A Baton Rouge, LA $2,670 108 $29.43 $0.75
Kansas City, MO Dahart, TX $2,904 123 $32.01 $0.81
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,250 104 $35.82 $0.91
Evansville, IN Raleigh, NC $2,231 114 $24.59 $0.62
Columbus, OH Raleigh, NC $2,120 115 $23.37 $0.59
Council Bluffs, IA  Stockton, CA $5,060 140 $55.78 $1.42
Soybeans Chicago, IL Baton Rouge, LA $2,855 108 $31.47 $0.86
Council Bluffs, 1A Baton Rouge, LA $2,715 108 $29.93 $0.81
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,960 110 $43.65 $1.19
Evansville, IN Raleigh, NC $2,231 114 $24.59 $0.67
Chicago, IL Raleigh, NC $2,831 111 $31.21 $0.85
Shuttle Train
Wheat St. Louis, MO Houston, TX $1,920 105 $21.16 $0.58
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,540 94 $39.02 $1.06
Corn Fremont, NE Houston, TX $2,268 107 $25.00 $0.64
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,168 105 $34.92 $0.89
Soybeans Council Bluffs, I1A Houston, TX $2,412 100 $26.59 $0.72
Minneapolis, MN Portland, OR $3,303 104 $36.41 $0.99

*A unit train refers to shipments of at least 52 cars. Shuttle train rates are available for qualified shipments of more

than 100 cars that meet railroad efficiency requirements.
“Approximate load per car = 100 short tons: corn 56 Ibs./bu., wheat & soybeans 60 Ibs./bu.

Sources: www.bnsf.com, www.cpr.ca, WwWw.CSX.Com, WWW.UPFT.com
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Table 8
Tariff Rail Ratesfor U.S. Bulk Grain Shipmentsto U.S.-Mexico Border Crossings

Effective date: 2/05/07 As % of
Origin  Border Train Tariff samemonth  Rateper Rate per
Commodity state crossingregion  size' rate’ last year metricton  bushel®
Whest KS Brownsville, TX Shuttle $2,959 104 $30.23 $0.82
ND Eagle Pass, TX Unit $4,545 111 $46.44 $1.26
OK El Paso, TX Shuttle $2,235 100 $22.84 $0.62
OK El Paso, TX Unit $2,540 104 $25.95 $0.71
AR Laredo, TX Unit $2,600 109 $26.57 $0.72
IL Laredo, TX Unit $3,405 107 $34.79 $0.95
MT Laredo, TX Shuttle $3,980 100 $40.67 $1.11
TX Laredo, TX Shuttle $2,274 105 $23.23 $0.63
MO Laredo, TX Shuttle $2,840 104 $29.02 $0.79
WiI Laredo, TX Unit $3,623 106 $37.02 $1.01
Corn NE Brownsville, TX Shuttle $3,761 106 $38.43 $0.98
NE Brownsville, TX Unit $4,001"* 110 $40.88 $1.04
1A Eagle Pass, TX Unit $3,991 106 $40.78 $1.03
MO Eagle Pass, TX Shuttle $3,850'* 114 $39.34 $1.00
NE Eagle Pass, TX Shuttle $4,250'* 113 $43.42 $1.10
1A Laredo, TX Shuttle $3,915 106 $40.00 $1.02
Soybean 1A Brownsville, TX Shuttle $3,537 107 $36.14 $0.98
MN Brownsville, TX Shuttle $3,718 103 $37.99 $1.03
NE Brownsville, TX Shuttle $3,345 107 $34.18 $0.93
NE Eagle Pass, TX Shuttle $3,422 107 $34.96 $0.95
1A Laredo, TX Unit $3,575 106 $36.53 $0.99

*A unit train refers to shi pments of at least 52 cars. Shuttle train are available for qualified shipments of more than 100 cars
that meet railroad efficiency requirements.

?Rates are based upon published tariff rates for high-capacity rail cars.

3Approximate load per car = 97.87 metric tons: Corn 56 |bs/bu, Wheat & Soybeans 60 Ibs/bu

*Hi gh-capacity rate not available, rate estimated using published low-capacity tariff rate x 1.08

Sources: www.bnsf.com, www.uprr.com

Figure 7
Railroad Fuel Surcharges, North American Weighted Average'
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March 2007: Down 14% from February 2007 surcharge of
504 - 13.3%; down 12% from March 2006 surcharge of 12.9%; and
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Sources: www.bnsf.com, www.cn.ca, WWW8.Cpr.Ca, WWW.CSX.com, Www.kesi.com, WWW.NScorp.com, Www.uprr.com

GTR 9 February 15, 2007



Barge Transportation

Figure 8
[llinois River Barge Rate Index - Quotes*?
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! Index = percent of tariff rate; 24-week moving average for the 3-year average
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AM SUSDA

Table9
Weekly Barge Rate Quotes. Southbound Bar ge Freight

Twin Mid- [llinois L ower Cairo-
Cities Mississippi River St. Louis  Cincinnati Ohio  Memphis
Index!  2/13/2007 n‘a n/a 363 283 282 282 218
2/6/2007 na n/a 358 233 268 268 196
$/ton 2/13/2007 na n/a 16.82 11.29 13.23 11.39 6.85
2/6/2007 na n‘a 16.61 9.30 12.57 10.83 6.15

Current week % change from the same week:
Last year n/a na -15 -27 -19 -20 -35
3-year avg. na na 23 7 10 9 -6
Index March n‘a 339 327 285 285 285 223
May 364 326 314 273 275 275 238

Yndex = percent of tariff, based on 1976 tariff benchmark rate; 24-week movi ng average.
Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AM SUSDA

Figure 9
Benchmark tariff rates

Calculating bargerate per ton:
(Index * 1976 tariff benchmark rate per ton)/100

Select applicable index from market quotes included in tables
onthispage. The 1976 benchmark rates per ton are provided
in map (seefigure 9).
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Figure 10

Bar ge Movements on the Mississippi River* (Locks 27 - Granite City, IL)
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Table 10
Barge Grain Movements (1,000 tons)
Week ending 2/10/2007 Corn Wheat Soybeans Other Total
Mississippi River
Rock Island, IL (L15) 0 0 0 0 0
Winfield, MO (L25) 9 0 9 0 18
Alton, IL (L26) 146 0 43 0 189
Granite City, IL (L27) 164 0 53 0 217
Illinois River (L8) 89 0 22 0 111
Ohio River (L52) 95 6 39 2 142
Arkansas River (L1) 0 8 15 7 30
Weekly total - 2007 259 14 106 9 389
Weekly total - 2006 471 24 180 22 697
2007 YTD! 2,157 9 1,018 73 3,344
2006 YTD 2,382 135 901 125 3,543
2007 as % of 2006 YTD 91 72 113 58 94
Last 4 weeks as % of 20067 84 46 104 78 87
Total 2006 27,439 1,442 7,733 719 37,332

*Weekly total, YTD (year-to-date) and calendar year total includes Miss/27, Ohio/52, and Ark/1; "Other" refersto oats, barley, sorghum, and rye.

2 Asa percent of same period in 2006.
Note: Total may not add exactly, due to rounding

Source: U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (www.mvr.usace.army.mil/mvrimi/omni/webrpts/default.asp)
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Upbound Empty Barges Transiting Mississippi River Lock 27

Figure 11
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Truck Transportation

The weekly diesdl price provides aproxy for trendsin U.S. truck rates. Diesel fudl is asignificant expense for
truck grain movements, accounting for 37 percent of the estimated variable cost.

Table 11
Retail on-Highway Diesel Prices', Week Ending 2/12/07 (US$/gallon)
Change from
Region L ocation Price Week ago Year ago
| East Coast 2.465 0.032 -0.044
New England 2.625 0.032 0.008
Central Atlantic 2.564 0.037 -0.027
Lower Atlantic 2.408 0.030 -0.056
1 Midwest" 2.429 0.052 0.010
11 Gulf Coast® 2.394 0.034 -0.053
v Rocky Mountain 2517 -0.006 0.017
\% West Coast 2777 0.057 0.156
Cadlifornia 2.905 0.080 0.196
Total U.S. 2.476 0.041 0.000
!Diesel fud pricesinclude all taxes.
2Same as North Central
3same as South Central

Source: Energy Information Administration/U.S. Department of Energy (www.eia.doe.gov)
Figure 13
Weekly Diesel Fuel Prices, U.S. Average

B Last year O Current year
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Source: Retail On-Highway Diesel Prices, Energy Information Administration, Dept. of Energy
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Grain Exports

Table 12
U.S. Export Balances and Cumulative Exports (1,000 metric tons)
Wheat Corn Soybeans Total
Week ending1 HRW SRW HRS SWW DUR All wheat
Export Balances
2/1/2007 1,526 656 1,013 1,004 114 4,313 11,687 6,686 22,686
This week year ago 1,751 299 1,057 687 104 3,898 8,455 4,247 16,600
Cumulative exports-crop year 2
2006/07 YTD 4,293 2,332 4,384 3,377 587 14,971 23,987 17,016 55,974
2005/06 YTD 7,725 1,424 5,431 2,920 555 18,055 20,518 13,954 52,527
YTD 2006/07 as % of 2005/06 56 164 81 116 106 83 117 122 107
Last 4 wks as % of same period 2005/06 86 193 104 146 86 110 142 163 140
2005/06 Total 10,459 2,037 7,244 4,159 930 24,828 54,354 25,570 104,752
2004/05 Total 9,407 3,217 8,083 4,773 686 26,166 44,953 29,878 100,997
 Current unshipped export sales to date
2 Shipped export sales to date
Note: YTD = year-to-date. Crop year: wheat = 6/01-5/31, corn & soybeans = 9/01-8/31
Source: Foreign Agricultural ServicelUSDA (www.fas.usda.gov)
Table 13
Top 5 Importers’ of U.S. Corn
Week ending 02/01/07 Total Commitments’ % change Exports’
2006/07 2005/06 current CY
Crop Year (CY) Current CY Last CY | fromlast CY 2005/06
- 1,000 mt - - 1,000 mt -
Japan 4 10,252 9,683 6 16,474
Mexico 6,295 3,628 74 6,653
Korea 2,282 1,781 28 5,573
Taiwan 2,737 2,767 (@D} 4,951
Egypt 1,838 1,953 (6) 4,298
Top 5importers 23,405 19,812 18 37,949
Total US corn export sales 35,674 28,973 23
Top 5importers share of U.S.
corn export sales 66% 68%
USDA forecast, Feb. 2007 57,150 54,610 5
Corn Usefor Ethanol USDA
forecast, Feb. 2007 54,610 40,640 34

(n) indicates negative number.

! Based on FAS 2005/06 Marketing Y ear Ranking Reports - www.fas.usda.gov; Marketing year = Sep 1 - Aug 31.

2 cumul ative Exports (shipped) + Outstanding Sales (unshipped); FAS Weekly Export Sales Report.
3FAS Marketing Year Final Reports - www.fas.usda.gov/export-sales/myfi_rpt.htm.
# Not included - FAS Dailv Press Release: Corn Export Salesto Iraa on 2/09: 140.208 mt for 2006/07.
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Table 14
Top5 Importersl of U.S. Soybeans

Week ending 02/01/07 Total Commitments? % change |  Exports’
2006/07 2005/06 current CY

Crop Year (CY) Current CY Last CY | fromlast CY 2005/06

-1,000 mt - - 1,000 mt -

China 9,814 7,319 34 9,706

Mexico 2,265 1,980 14 3,594

Japan 1,981 1,873 6 3,019

EU-25 2,644 1,491 77 2,123

Taiwan 1,254 1,110 13 1,850

Top 5importers 17,958 13,773 30 20,292

Total US soybean export sales 23,702 18,201 30

Top 5importers shareof U.S.

soybean export sales 76% 76%

USDA forecast, Feb. 2007 29,940 25,800 16

(n) indicates negative number.

'Based on FAS 2005/06 Marketing Y ear Ranking Reports - www.fas.usda.gov; Marketing year = Sep 1 - Aug 31.
ZCumulative Exports (shipped) + Outstanding Sales (unshipped).

% FAS Marketing Y ear Final Reports - www.fas.usda.gov/export-sales'myfi_rpt.htm.

Table 15

Top 10 Importers' of All U.S. Wheat

Week ending 02/01/07 Total Commitments? % change Exports’®
2006/07 2005/06 current CY

Crop Year (CY) Current CY Last CY | fromlast CY 2005/06

-1,000 mt - -1,000 mt -

Nigeria 2,022 2,680 (25) 3,098

Japan 2,626 2,557 3 3,061

Mexico 1,655 2,180 (24) 2,625

Iraq 898 2,131 (58) 1,237

Philippines 1,504 1,498 0 1,878

Egypt 1,686 1,001 68 1,952

Korea, South 972 968 0 1,191

Venezuela 598 842 (29 1,085

Taiwan 816 750 9 953

Italy 479 675 (29) 748

Top 10 importers 13,255 15,280 (13) 17,827

Total USwheat export sales 19,284 21,953 (12

Top 10 importers share of

U.S. wheat export sales 69% 70%

USDA forecast, Feb. 2007 23,810 27,460 (13)

(n) indicates negative number.

'Based on FAS 2005/06 Marketing Y ear Ranking Reports - www.fas.usda.gov; Marketing year = Jun 1 - May 31.
ZCumulative Exports (shipped) + Outstanding Sales (unshipped); FAS Weekly Export Sales Report.

*FAS Marketing Y ear Final Reports - www.fas.usda.gov/export-sales/myfi_rpt.htm.
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Table 16
Grain Inspectionsfor Export by U.S. Port Region (1,000 metric tons)

Port Week ending 2007 YTD as | Last 4-weeksas% of Total*
regions 02/08/07 | 2007 YTD'| 2006 YTD" |% of 2006 YTD 2006 3-yr. avg. 2006
Pacific Northwest
Wheat 205 1,540 1,378 112 107 112 11,083
Corn 0 801 969 83 78 73 9,556
Soybeans 193 1,014 773 131 120 140 6,049
Total 398 3,354 3,120 108 103 107 26,688
Mississippi Gulf
Wheat 97 531 546 97 93 81 4,124
Corn 794 3,831 3,925 98 107 115 35,462
Soybeans 482 2,995 2,745 109 113 104 16,222
Total 1,373 7,358 7,216 102 108 107 55,808
Texas Gulf
Wheat 36 493 1,151 43 55 56 5,078
Corn 35 121 79 154 223 165 3,055
Soybeans 0 28 10 288 1,570 1,118 153
Total 71 642 1,240 52 68 68 8,286
Great L akes
Wheat 0 0 0 n‘a 0 0 1,382
Corn 0 10 0 n‘a 0 0 1,701
Soybeans 0 0 52 0 0 0 1,113
Total 0 10 52 20 0 0 4,196
Atlantic
Wheat 0 92 13 688 459 382 686
Corn 55 111 0 22942 177 410 736
Soybeans 0 88 1 10384 217 114 621
Total 55 290 15 1981 238 229 2,043
U.S. total from ports?
Wheat 338 2,655 3,089 86 89 90 22,354
Corn 884 4,874 4,973 98 104 109 50,509
Soybeans 675 4,125 3,581 115 117 111 24,157
Total 1,897 11,654 11,642 100 104 105 97,020

Includes weekly revisions
2 Total includes only port regions shown above
Source: Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Administration/USDA (www.gipsa.usda.gov); Y TD= year-to-date; n/a= not applicable

The United States exports approximately one-quarter of the grain it produces. On average, it includes nearly 45 percent of U.S.-grown wheat,
35 percent of U.S.-grown soybeans, and 20 percent of the U.S.-grown corn. Approximately 51 percent of these U.S. export grain shipments
departed through the Mississippi Gulf region in 2006.
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Figure 14
U.S. grain inspected for export (wheat, corn, and soybeans)
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Source: Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Administration/USDA (www.gipsa.usda.gov)
Note: 3-year average consists of 4-week running average

Figure 15

Weekly U.S. Grain Inspections. U.S. Gulf and PNW (wheat, corn, and soybeans)

60 - -
s Miss. Gulf
PNW
Texas Gulf )
50 44¢#\v - aNIYV N\ ----- 4 wk. Mov. Avg. (Miss. Gulf)
----- 4 wk. Mov. Avg. (PNW) K
----- 4wk. Mov. Avg. (T Gulf) .
%)
)
B
>
o
c
i=
z
0 T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T
[Te) [Te) [Te) (o] O © © © © © © © © © © N~ D~
o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o o
) o [ &) &) %) %) %) %) o o o o o %) &) o
S = S = 3N %) 3 [rs) [ = > > 3 = S = «
- - - -l i i
Source: Grain Inspection, Packers and Stockyards Administration/USDA (www.gipsa.usda.gov)
Feb 8: % change from: MSGulf TX Gulf U.S Gulf PNW
Last week up 2 down49 down3 down48
Last year (same week) up13  down56 up5 down38
3-yr avg. (4-wk mov. avg) up9  down 32 up 0.3 up 33
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Ocean Transportation

Table 17
Weekly Port Region Grain Ocean Vessal Activity (number of vessels)
Pacific Vancouver
Gulf Northwest B.C.
Loaded Due next
Date In port 7-days 10-days In port In port
2/8/2007 48 45 68 11 8
2/1/2007 53 51 76 6 12
2006 range (16..40) (31..56) (45..81) (1..17) (2.13)
2006 avg. 27 42 58 8 7

Source: Transportation & Marketing Programs/AMS/USDA

Figure 16
U.S. Gulf* Vessel Loading Activity, 2005/06
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1U.S. Gulf includes Mississippi, Texas, and East Gulf.
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Figure 17

Grain Vessel Rates, U.S. to Japan
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Source: Baltic Exchange (www.balticexchange.com)
Table 18
Ocean Freight Rates For Selected Shipments, Week Ending 2/10/2007
Export Import Grain Loading Volume loads Freight rate
region region types date (metric tons) (US$/metric ton)
U.S. Gulf Japan Hvy Grain Nov1/15 54,000 50.50
U.S. Gulf Japan Hvy Grain Nov 4/11 54,000 49.50
U.S. Gulf China Hvy Grain Nov 15/20 55,000 46.00
U.S. Gulf Egypt Hvy Grain Oct 10/20 60,000 33.50
U.S. Gulf Sudan/K enya' Sorghum Nov 6/16 46,530 92.40
U.S. Gulf Algeria Maize Dec 1/2 25,000 35.25
U.S. Gulf Tunisia Maize Jan 5/10 23,000 50.00
St. Lawrence Morocco Hvy Grain Nov 25/Dec 5 25,000 32.00
Romania Portugal Hvy Grain Nov 20/30 20,000 25.00
Canada China Barley Sept 15/25 50,000 39.75
France India Grain Oct 15/30 60,000 26.00
River Plate Algeria Grain Jan 23/25 25,000 58.00
River Plate Poland Grain Jan 20/30 25,000 49.00
River Plate Algeria Corn Nov 2/7 30,000 46.50

Rates shown are for metric ton (2,204.62 |bs. = 1 metric ton), F.O.B., except where otherwise indicates; op = option
75 percent of food aid from the United Statesis required to be shipped on U.S.-flag vessdls.
Source; Maritime Research Inc. (www.maritime-research.com)
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Figure 18
Ocean Rates' for Containerized Shipmentsto Selected Asian Countries
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'Rates are weighted by shipping line market share and destination country.

Countriesinclude: Animal Feed: Bangkok-Thailand (6%), Busan-Korea (18%), Hong Kong (25%), Kachsiung-Taiwan (17%),
Keelung-Taiwan (8%), Tokyo-Japan (26%). Soybeans: Busan-Korea (2%), Hong Kong (1%), Kaohsiung-Taiwan (96%), Tokyo-Japan (1%)
Source: Ocean Rate Bulletin, Quarter 4, 2006, Transportation & Marketing Programs/AMS/USDA

Container ocean freight rates — average rate per twenty-foot equivalent unit (TEU) weighted by shipping line
market share and trade route.

During 2005, containers were used to transport 4 percent of total U.S. grain exported, and 5 percent of total
U.S. grain exported to Asia.

Figure 19
Monthly Shipments of Containerized Grain to Asia

24,000 { W= Jan.-Nov. 2006 November '06: Up 35% from November '05
= 3-year average and 95% above the 3-year average

21,000 A
18,000 -
15,000 -

12,000

20-foot containers

5§O

6,000

g
=

Apr.
June
July
Aug
Sept.
Oct
Nov
Dec.

g g

Source: Port Import Export Reporting Service (PIERS), Journal of Commerce
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(202)720-2600 (Voice and TDD).

To file acomplaint of discrimination, write USDA, Director of Civil Rights, Room 326-W, Whitten Building, 14" and Independence Avenue, SW, Washington,
DC 20250-9410, or call (202) 720-5964 (voice and TDD). USDA is an equal opportunity provider and employer.
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